Farmer Ellsworth Osburn Jackies j
Farmer and ) Ellsworth . Osburn AMS Grounds . X Jackies
X Farmer and Farmer and Underwood Ellsworth Ellsworth Industries . Osburn Osburn Industries , AMS . AMS Grounds Jackies Jackies Transport
e Approximate Underwood . ) A . Industries Total ) . . Industries Total AMS Grounds Additional i . Transport Total
Item Description K Underwood Underwood . Total with Industries | Industries Additional ) Industries | Industries Additional . Grounds ) . Total with Transport | Transport Additional K
Annual Quantity . . Additional X . R with Standard X ) A with Standard . Freight/Ton Freight . ) . ) with Standard
Material Freight/Ton ) Standard Material | Freight/Ton| Freight/Ton A Material | Freight/Ton | Freight/Ton N Material Standard Freight] Material | Freight/Ton | Freight/Ton A
Freight/Ton Frost X Freight Freight Frost/Ton Freight
Freight Erost Erost Erost
MDOT 21aa Limestone 4500 S 10.15]$ 4.95 NA S 67,950.00] $ 1055] S 5.00 NA S 69,975.00) $ 10.40|S$ 6.00 | S 3.00 S 73,800.00 | $ 11.50] $ 550] $ 11.00] $ 76,500.00] $ 11.50] $ 5.99 NA $ 78,705.00
,705.
MDOT 23a 2000 S 10.15| S 4.95 NA S 30,200.00] $ 9.80] $ 5.00 NA S 29,600.00] S 10.40 | $ 6.00 | S 3.00|s 32,800.00 | S 11.50] $ 5.50] $ 11.00] $ 34,000.00] $ 11.50] $ 5.99 NA S 34,980.00
MDOT 3" x 1" Course 300 S 1190} $ 4.95 NA S 5,055.00] $ 10.50| $ 5.00 NA S 4,650.00]$ 12.00 | $ 6.00 | S 3.00 S 5,400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S -]s$ 13.00] s 5.99 NA $ 5.697.00
Aggregate , .
4” x 8” Limestone Rip
 Rap 250 S 1945 (S 4.95 NA S 6,100.00] $ 15.25] $ 5.00 NA S 5,062.50] $ 12.00 | $ 8.50|s 4751$ 5,125.00 | $ 21.45] $ 5.50] $ 11.00] S 6,737.50] $ 24.00] S 8.99 NA $  8,247.50
;}: 16" Limestone Rip 50 S 26.00 | S 5.50 NA S 1,575.00] $ 28.25] S 6.00 NA S 1,712.50|$ 28.00 | $ 850 |S 4.75|$ 1,825.00 | $ 28.27] $ 550] $ 11.00] s 1,688.50| S 34.00] $ 11.49 NA $ 2274.50
16” x 24” Limestone . .

N 50 No Bid No Bid NA S -]$ 2825]%S 6.00 NA S 1,712.50]$ 32.00]$ 8.50|s 4751$ 2,025.00 | $ 33.00] $ 7.50] $ 15.00] S 2,025.00] $ 36.00] S 11.49 NA $  2,37450
Rip Rap 3 -
18” x 24” Limestone . . .

) 50 S 26.00 | $ 5.50 NA S 1,575.00] $ 28.25] S 6.00 NA S 1,712.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid S - $ 33.00] $ 7.50] $ 15.00] $ 2,025.00] $ 36.00] $ 11.49 NA $ 2374.50
Rip Rap , -
6A MDOT Li t

fmestone 500 $ 1260 | ¢ 495 NA $ 877500 $ 12005 500 NA $  850000|$ 2250|$  725|¢  350|$ 14875.00] ¢ 25.58] ¢ as0] $ 9.00]$ 1504000  $ 1400] 8 799 NA

Washed $ 10,995.00
2MS Masonry Sand 50 S 8851 5.45 NA S 715.00] $ 8.50] $ 7.00 NA S 775.00] $ 9.00 | S 7.00 | S 350 S 800.00 | $ 8.85] S 550] $ 11.00] $ 717.50| $ 8.50] $ 8.49 NA S 849.50
2NS Sand 1500 S 10.25| S 4.95 NA S 22,800.00] $ 9.75] $ 5.00 NA S 22,125.000$ 10.75 | $ 425]$ 2.00|s 22,500.00 | S 14.85] $ 5.00] $ 10.00] $ 29,775.00] $ 6.00] S 7.49 NA $ 20,235.00
Topsoil 350 S 8.00] S 6.25 NA S 4,987.50| $ 9.50] $ 6.00 NA S 5,425.00]$ 10.00 | $ 4.25]$ 2.00|S 4,987.50 | $ 12.10] $ 550] $ 11.00] S 6,160.00] $ 10.00] $ 8.35 NA S 6,422.50
Class Il Sand 5000 S 450 S 5.45 NA S 49,750.00] $ 450] S 7.00 NA S 57,500.00| $ 5.50 | $ 4251S 200|$ 48,75000]S 4.13]S$S 8.25] $ 16.50] $ 61,900.00] $ 4.00] s 6.99 NA $ 54,950.00
Spoils Haul Out 6500 S 6.50 |[FU Dump S 42,250.00 S 6.85 |Ellsworth $  44,525.00 S 9.00 Misc S 58,500.00 | $ 23.82] $ 6.85| $13.70 Landfill | $ 199,355.00 S 7.99 Misc $ 51,935.00
Concrete Haul Out As Needed $ 7.50 JFU Dump S 6.00 |Ellsworth s 9.00 Misc S -1s 10.00 ] $20.00 Landfill S 9.99 Misc
Street Sweepings As Needed S 6.50 JAdvanced Landfill $ 11.00]s$ 8.00 |E Sauk Trail No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.19] S 6.85] $13.70 Misc S 8.99 Misc
Asphalt Haul Out As Needed $ 6.50 |FU Dump S 7.50 |$3.00 Haas Rd. S 9.00 Misc S -1s 10.00] $20.00 Misc S 8.99 Misc

TOTAL| $ 241,732.50 TOTAL| $ 253,275.00 TOTAL $ 271,387.50 TOTAL $ 435,923.50 TOTAL $ 280,040.00




