PUBLIC SERVICES AREA -- FLEET and FACILITIES UNIT

QUOTATION FORM

Ŋ	1
Jul	
Date	
Lynn Crum	
g Quotes_	
Soliciting	
erson	

2017

Auche Forcing Auche Forcin	Harper Electric 6920 Jackson Rd. Ann Arbor, Mi. 48103 Brian Howard 734-662-8367 734-662-8367 734-662-8304 It of Unit Price Total 86.00/hr 172.00/hr 173.00/hr 173.00/hr 173.00/hr 173.00/hr 174.00/hr 175.00/hr 175.	Descr	Description of Item(s)	Date		6/22	6/22/2017						
Ann Arbor, Mi. 48103 Suite 100 Ann Arbor, Mi. 48104 Suite 100 Suite 100 Chelsea, Mi. 4818 Brian Howard Unit of Unit Measur Price Total Price Total Price Total To	e, Zip Person Brian Howard Ann Arbor, Mi. 48103 Person Brian Howard A34-662-8367 Duit of Unit Measur Price R6.00/hr 129.00/hr 129.00/hr 172.00/hr 15% -0015% TElectric held the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure the sum of the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure the sum of the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement price has worked on many city projects, resure that the price has worked on many city projects, resure that the price has worked on many city projects, resure that the price has worked on many city projects, resure that the price has worked on many city projects, resure that the price has a sure that the price ha	Quote mat.l i	for hourly rates & nark-up for blanket	Vendor		Harper	· Electric	Нор	p Electric	Vetter Ele	ectric		
Section Brian Howard Chelsea, Mi. 48118 Section Brian Howard Chelsea, Mi. 48118 Section Se	e, Zip Person Brian Howard T34-662-8367 Duit of Unit Measur Price R6.00/hr 129.00/hr 172.00/hr 15% -0- -0- r Electric held the blanket agreement prerimans worked on many city projects, resurence.	agree	ment regarding cal work for various	Address		6920 J	lackson Rd. r, Mi. 48103	720 W.	Industrial Dr. te 100	Ann Arbor N	tart St. di 48104		
Price Price Total Pric	Person Brian Howard Imber 734-662-8367 ber 734-662-8367 Unit of Unit of Unit Price Total Reasur Price Total Reasur 129.00/hr 172.00/hr 15% -0015% Flectric held the blanket agreement prering worked on many city projects, resure that worked on many city projects, resure that the blanket agreement prering that worked on many city projects, resure that worked on many city projects which worked that	City C	wned Facilities.	City, State	, Zip			Chelse	3a, Mi. 48118				
Def 734-662-8367 Def Control of Unit	umber ber Unit of U Measur Pr e Fr thas worked on the theorem of t			Contact P	erson	Brian	Howard						
Unit of Unit	Measur Present			Phone Nu	ımber	734-66	32-8367						
Unit of Price Unit Duit Duit Unit Duit	Unit of Weasur Present			Fax Numb)er	734-66	32-8304						
Measur Price Total Price Total Price 86.00/hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 129.00/hr 172.00/hr 15% Image: Control of the big bid of the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r Electric r Electric RIDS: DATE: 7/6/1/7 DATE: 7/6/1/7	Measur Pr e e r Electric held th r has worked on r Electric				Unit of	Unit		Unit		Unit		Unit	
129.00/hr	r Electric held the has worked on r Electric	o Z	Description	Quan.	Measur	Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
129.00/hr 172.00/hr 15% -00- r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held the has worked on r Electric	7.	Blanket Quote: Elect.	Std,Lab.			86.00/hr		No Bid		No Bid		
r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held th r has worked on r Electric	2.		O.T.			129.00/hr						
r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held th r has worked on r Electric	<i>ب</i> ع		Hol.			172.00/hr						
r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held the has worked on r Electric	4.		Mať!.			15%						
r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held the has worked on relectric	5.		Travel			o-						
r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held the rhas worked on r Electric BIDS:	6.	Total										
r Electric held the blanket agreement previous to this bid. r has worked on many city projects, results have been good. r Electric	r Electric held the rhas worked on r Electric	REMA	RKS AND EXCEPTION										
r Electric BIDS: M. J. C.	r Electric			Harper	Electric he	ld the blan	ket agreemen	t previous	to this bid.				
r Electric BIDS: M F. C.	RECOMMENDED VENDOR: Harper Electric SIGNATURE OF PERSON RECEIVING BIDS:			2	200	d out maily	city projects,	courts Hav	e peen good.				
BIDS: We of Change	SIGNATURE OF PERSON RECEIVING BIDS: M C C C APPROVED BY PURCHASING AGENT:	RECC	MMENDED VENDOR:		. Electric								
	APPROVED BY PURCHASING AGENT:	SIGN	ATURE OF PERSON R	ECEIVING E	SIDS:	00	J. Comment		Ω	ATE: 7/6	112		
		APPR	OVED BY PURCHASIN	JG AGENT:						ATE			



Vendor Conflict of Interest Disclosure Form

All vendors interested in conducting business with the City of Ann Arbor must complete and return the Vendor Conflict of Interest Disclosure Form in order to be eligible to be awarded a contract. Please note that all vendors are subject to comply with the City of Ann Arbor's conflict of interest policies as stated within the certification section below.

If a vendor has a relationship with a City of Ann Arbor official or employee, an immediate family member of a City of Ann Arbor official or employee, the vendor shall disclose the information required below.

- No City official or employee or City employee's immediate family member has an ownership interest in vendor's company or is deriving personal financial gain from this contract.
- 2. No retired or separated City official or employee who has been retired or separated from the City for less than one (1) year has an ownership interest in vendor's Company.
- 3. No City employee is contemporaneously employed or prospectively to be employed with the vendor.
- Vendor hereby declares it has not and will not provide gifts or hospitality of any dollar value or any other gratuities to any City employee or elected official to obtain or maintain a contract.
- 5. Please note any exceptions below:

	interest Di	isclosure*
Name of City of Ann Arbor employees, elected	d ()R	Relationship to employee
officials or immediate family members with whom there may be a potential conflict of interest.	om () Ir	nterest in vendor's company
		Other (please describe in box below)
Disclosing a potential conflict of interest does not di conflicts of interest and they are detected by the City	squalify vendo vendor will b	ors. In the event vendors do not disclose potent e exempt from doing business with the City.
I certify that this Conflict of Interest Discontents are true and correct to my known that you behalf of the Vendor by my significant.	wiedge an	d belief and I have the authority to so
I certify that this Conflict of Interest Discontents are true and correct to my kno certify on behalf of the Vendor by my significant.	nature bel	d belief and I have the authority to so ow: 34-662-8367
contents are true and correct to my know	nature bel	d belief and I have the authority to so ow:
contents are true and correct to my know	wiledge and nature bel	d belief and I have the authority to so ow: 34-662-8367

Questions about this form? Contact Procurement Office City of Ann Arbor Phone: 734/794-6500, procurement@a2gov.org

CITY OF ANN ARBOR DECLARATION OF COMPLIANCE

Non-Discrimination Ordinance

The "non discrimination by city contractors" provision of the City of Ann Arbor Non-Discrimination Ordinance (Ann Arbor City Code Chapter 112, Section 9:158) requires all contractors proposing to do business with the City to treat employees in a manner which provides equal employment opportunity and does not discriminate against any of their employees, any City employee working with them, or any applicant for employment on the basis of actual or perceived age, arrest record, color, disability, educational association, familial status, family responsibilities, gender expression, gender identity, genetic information, height, HIV status, marital status, national origin, political beliefs, race, religion, sex, sexual orientation, source of income, veteran status, victim of domestic violence or stalking, or weight. It also requires that the contractors include a similar provision in all subcontracts that they execute for City work or programs.

In addition the City Non-Discrimination Ordinance requires that all contractors proposing to do business with the City of Ann Arbor must satisfy the contract compliance administrative policy adopted by the City Administrator. A copy of that policy may be obtained from the Purchasing Manager

The Contractor agrees:

- (a) To comply with the terms of the City of Ann Arbor's Non-Discrimination Ordinance and contract compliance administrative policy, including but not limited to an acceptable affirmative action program if applicable.
- (b) To post the City of Ann Arbor's Non-Discrimination Ordinance Notice in every work place or other location in which employees or other persons are contracted to provide services under a contract with the City.
- (c) To provide documentation within the specified time frame in connection with any workforce verification, compliance review or complaint investigation.
- (d) To permit access to employees and work sites to City representatives for the purposes of monitoring compliance, or investigating complaints of non-compliance.

The undersigned states that he/she has the requisite authority to act on behalf of his/her employer in these matters and has offered to provide the services in accordance with the terms of the Ann Arbor Non-Discrimination Ordinance. The undersigned certifies that he/she has read and is familiar with the terms of the Non-Discrimination Ordinance, obligates the Contractor to those terms and acknowledges that if his/her employer is found to be in violation of Ordinance it may be subject to civil penalties and termination of the awarded contract.

Signature of Authorized Representative

DLAN Howard V.P.

Print Name and Title

1920 TACK 50 n RD Ann ARbor MI 4810 3

Address, City, State, Zip

honoremail Address

Questions about the Notice or the City Administrative Policy, Please contact:
Procurement Office of the City of Ann Arbor
(734) 794-6500

CITY OF ANN ARBOR LIVING WAGE ORDINANCE DECLARATION OF COMPLIANCE

The Ann Arbor Living Wage Ordinance (Section 1:811–1:821 of Chapter 23 of Title I of the Code) requires that an employer who is (a) a contractor providing services to or for the City for a value greater than \$10,000 for any twelvementh contract term, or (b) a recipient of federal, state, or local grant funding administered by the City for a value greater than \$10,000, or (c) a recipient of financial assistance awarded by the City for a value greater than \$10,000, shall pay its employees a prescribed minimum level of compensation (i.e., Living Wage) for the time those employees perform work on the contract or in connection with the grant or financial assistance. The Living Wage must be paid to these employees for the length of the contract/program.

Companies employing fewer than 5 persons and non-profits employing fewer than 10 persons are exempt from compliance with the Living Wage Ordinance. If this exemption applies to your company/non-profit agency please check here [___] No. of employees___

The Contractor or Grantee agrees:

(a) To pay each of its employees whose wage level is not required to comply with federal, state or local prevailing wage law, for work covered or funded by a contract with or grant from the City, no less than the Living Wage. The current Living Wage is defined as \$13.13/hour for those employers that provide employee health care (as defined in the Ordinance at Section 1:815 Sec. 1 (a)), or no less than \$14.65/hour for those employers that do not provide health care. The Contractor or Grantor understands that the Living Wage is adjusted and established annually on April 30 in accordance with the Ordinance and covered employers shall be required to pay the adjusted amount thereafter to be in compliance (Section 1:815(3).

Check the applicable b	hox below which	applies to	vour workforce
oncon are approaute t	JON DOIGH BILLIGH	uppiics to	your morniores

Employees who are assigned to any covered City contract/grant will be paid at or above the applicable living wage without health benefits

Employees who are assigned to any covered City contract/grant will be paid at or above the applicable living wage with health benefits

- (b) To post a notice approved by the City regarding the applicability of the Living Wage Ordinance in every work place or other location in which employees or other persons contracting for employment are working.
- (c) To provide to the City payroll records or other documentation within ten (10) business days from the receipt of a request by the City.
- (d) To permit access to work sites to City representatives for the purposes of monitoring compliance, and investigating complaints or non-compliance.
- (e) To take no action that would reduce the compensation, wages, fringe benefits, or leave available to any employee covered by the Living Wage Ordinance or any person contracted for employment and covered by the Living Wage Ordinance in order to pay the living wage required by the Living Wage Ordinance.

The undersigned states that he/she has the requisite authority to act on behalf of his/her employer in these matters and has offered to provide the services or agrees to accept financial assistance in accordance with the terms of the Living Wage Ordinance. The undersigned certifies that he/she has read and is familiar with the terms of the Living Wage Ordinance, obligates the Employer/Grantee to those terms and acknowledges that if his/her employer is found to be in violation of Ordinance it may be subject to civil penalties and termination of the awarded contract or grant of financial assistance.

HAX DEV ELECTRIC FIRC 6930 JACKSON RD
Street Address

Ann Arbox M7 48103

City, State, Zip

BRIAN Howard, V.P bhoward charper electric: 1124

Print Name and Title

Phone/Email address

734-662-8367

City of Ann Arbor Procurement Office, 734/794-6500, procurement@a2gov.org

Rev. 2/7/17, LW-2

CITY OF ANN ARBOR PREVAILING WAGE DECLARATION OF COMPLIANCE

The "wage and employment requirements" of Section 1:320 of Chapter 14 of Title I of the Ann Arbor City Code mandates that the city not enter any contract, understanding or other arrangement for a public improvement for or on behalf of the city unless the contract provides that all craftsmen, mechanics and laborers employed directly on the site in connection with said improvements, including said employees of subcontractors, shall receive the prevailing wage for the corresponding classes of craftsmen, mechanics and laborers, as determined by statistics for the Ann Arbor area compiled by the United States Department of Labor. Where the contract and the Ann Arbor City Code are silent as to definitions of terms required in determining contract compliance with regard to prevailing wages, the definitions provided in the Davis-Bacon Act as amended (40 U.S.C. 278-a to 276-a-7) for the terms shall be used. Further, to the extent that any employees of the contractor providing services under this contract are not part of the class of craftsmen, mechanics and laborers who receive a prevailing wage in conformance with section 1:320 of Chapter 14 of Title I of the Code of the City of Ann Arbor, employees shall be paid a prescribed minimum level of compensation (i.e. Living Wage) for the time those employees perform work on the contract in conformance with section 1:815 of Chapter 23 of Title I of the Code of the City of Ann Arbor.

At the request of the city, any contractor or subcontractor shall provide satisfactory proof of compliance with this provision.

The Contractor agrees:

- (a) To pay each of its employees whose wage level is required to comply with federal, state or local prevailing wage law, for work covered or funded by this contract with the City,
- (b) To require each subcontractor performing work covered or funded by this contract with the City to pay each of its employees the applicable prescribed wage level under the conditions stated in subsection (a) or (b) above.
- (c) To provide to the City payroll records or other documentation within ten (10) business days from the receipt of a request by the City.
- (d) To permit access to work sites to City representatives for the purposes of monitoring compliance, and investigating complaints or non-compliance.

The undersigned states that he/she has the requisite authority to act on behalf of his/her employer in these matters and has offered to provide the services in accordance with the terms of the wage and employment provisions of the Chapter 14 of the Ann Arbor City Code. The undersigned certifies that he/she has read and is familiar with the terms of Section 1:320 of Chapter 14 of the Ann Arbor City Code and by executing this Declaration of Compliance obligates his/her employer and any subcontractor employed by it to perform work on the contract to the wage and employment requirements stated herein. The undersigned further acknowledges and agrees that if it is found to be in violation of the wage and employment requirements of Section 1:320 of the Chapter 14 of the Ann Arbor City Code it shall has be deemed a material breach of the terms of the contract and grounds for termination of same by the City.

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

Blian Howard, V.P.

Print Name and Title K50n RD, Han Akbar M1 48103

Address, City, State, Zip

Date Date

Address, City, State, Zip

Date Date

And Aldress City State Date

And Company Compan

Questions about this form? Contact Procurement Office City of Ann Arbor Phone: 734/794-6500

9/25/15 Rev 0

On-Call Electrical Pricing Proposal

Contractor Name: HAKPER ELECTRIC FIC
Contractor Address: 6920 JACKSON RD, Ann Arbor MI 48103
Office Phone: 734-662-8367 Fax: 734-662-8394
Primary Contact: Name BRIAN Howard
Email Address: bhoward e harper-electric, net
Standard Hourly Rate (Mon-Fri. 7a-5p): \$ 86 °°
Overtime Hourly Rate (after 5p,holiday,weekend): \$
Holiday Hourly Rate (if different from normal OT): \$ 172-
Travel / Show-Up Charge (max. 30 min. if applies): \$
Materials / Sub-Contractor Mark-Up: \$ Materials / 50 / 5ub 500

Terms

- See attached PO terms for payment information. Invoicing must be submitted on a per job basis.
- The work will be on-call, as needed basis determined by the City.
- There is no guaranteed minimum work or hours under this proposal.
- No special contractor parking will be provided.
- The City retains the right to use other Electrical contractors as necessary for this work, specific equipment or special projects as best fits the needs of the City.
- Contractor must comply with the City's Living Wage requirements.