
Field Operations

ITB 4341

Bid Tab

Farmer - Bid incorrectly

Fuel surcharge YES Fuel surcharge NO Fuel surcharge NO Fuel surcharge YES

Item # Product Est Annual Qnty Material Freight ton total Item total Material Freight Total per ton Item total Material Freight Total per ton Item total Material Freight

1 MDOT 21aa 3300 $6.95 $5.50 $12.45 n/a $7.15 $5.00 $12.15 $40,095.00 $7.50 $5.00 $12.50 n/a $11.49 no bid

2 MDOT Plain Rip Rap 250 $21.00 $8.50 $29.50 n/a $13.00 $10.00 $23.00 $5,750.00 $17.50 $6.00 $23.50 n/a $24.90 no bid

3 MDOT Heavy Rip Rap 150 $19.00 $8.50 $27.50 $4,125.00 $19.00 $10.00 $29.00 n/a $17.50 $6.00 $23.50 n/a $26.65 no bid

4 MDOT 6a Limestone Washed 500 $12.00 $6.75 $18.75 n/a $8.40 $5.00 $13.40 $6,700.00 $9.60 $5.00 $14.60 n/a $13.74 no bid

5 1x3 Commercial Limestone 300 $7.75 $5.50 $13.25 n/a $8.00 $5.00 $13.00 $3,900.00 $9.00 $5.00 $14.00 n/a $12.96 no bid

6 2NS Sand 2300 $6.50 $4.00 $10.50 n/a $4.75 $5.00 $9.75 $22,425.00 $4.50 $5.00 $9.50 n/a $8.09 no bid

7 Topsoil 220 $12.50 $6.75 $19.25 n/a $8.00 $8.00 $16.00 $3,520.00 $8.00 $5.00 $13.00 n/a $17.77 no bid

8 Haul Out 2074.074 na $6.75 $6.75 n/a na $6.75 $6.75 $14,000.00 na $18.00 $18.00 n/a na 6.75

Award value $4,125.00 $96,390.00

Disqualified Bidders

Osburn - No Bid Bond submitted

Farmer - Failed to follow bid instruction - Didn't bid freight rate - Unable to calc fuel surcharge on freight portion of bid as result

StoneCo Ellsworth Osburn (no bid bond)


