| 1 |Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon)
Supplier QTY UuUoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
1,000-1,999 gals/del
$3.20/gal2,000-2999 gals/del
$2.20/gal 3,000-3,999 gals/del
$1.90/gal4,000-4,499 gals/del
$1.75/gal4,500+ gals/del

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 GAL $1.68 $1.68 $1.68/gal JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 0
Price is based on full tanker truck

Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 GAL $1.86 $1.86 deliveries. Alexander Chemical Corporation 63300-10201000

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 GAL $1.99 $1.99 Olin 100137

Rowell Chemical 1 GAL $2.08 $2.08 Rowell Chemical hypo-15-rc-b

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid

Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid

Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 GAL No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 GAL No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid

Pencco, Inc 1 GAL No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid

Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 GAL No Bid

| 2 |Sodium Hypochlorite Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Supplier QTY UuUoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Rowell Chemical 1 HR $75.00 $75.00 Rowell Chemical demurrage
Demurrage fee starts after 2

Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 HR $100.00 $100.00 hours. Alexander Chemical Corporation 63300-10201000

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR $100.00 $100.00 Olin 100137

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 HR No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Pencco, Inc 1 HR No Bid

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 HR No Bid
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| 3 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- 40,000 Ibs. minimum shipments

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Pencco, Inc 1 TON $430.00 $430.00 Any NSF certified manufacturer N/A
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 TON $530.00 $530.00 Momentive and Nutrien 16150742 AND 16141271
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 TON $578.00 $578.00 Simplot 65300-10201000
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
| 4 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- 30,000 Ibs. minimum shipments
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 TON $560.00 $560.00 Momentive and Nutrien 16150742 AND 16141271
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 TON $608.00 $608.00 Simplot 65300-10201000
Pencco, Inc 1 TON $608.00 $608.00 Any NSF certified manufacturer N/A
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

| 5 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- multiple locations in 40,000 Ibs. minimum shipments

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 TON $540.00 $540.00 Momentive and Nutrien 16150742 AND 16141271
Pencco, Inc 1 TON $551.00 $551.00 Any NSF certified manufacturer N/A
** $75.00 fee if making multiple
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 TON $578.00 $578.00 stops ** Simplot 65300-10201000
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
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| 6 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 HR $0.00 $0.00 Momentive and Nutrien 16150742 AND 16141271
Demurrage fee starts after 2
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 HR $100.00 $100.00 hours. Simplot 65300-10201000
Pencco, Inc 1 HR $200.00 $200.00 Any NSF certified manufacturer N/A
Rowell Chemical 1 HR No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 HR No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
| 7 |Ferric Chloride- Dry Tons
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON $1,142.00 $1,142.00 PVS Technologies, Inc, No Alternative
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON $1,273.83 $1,273.83 price per dry ton Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Kemira PIX-311
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 TON No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

| 8 |Ferric Chloride-Demurrage (first 4 hours free)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Pricing is per Dry Ton. Demurrage
is $125.00 an hour. (After first 4

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 EA $125.00 $125.00 hours free) PVS Technologies, Inc. No Alternative
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 EA $150.00 $150.00 rate per hour Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Demurrage
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 EA No Bid

Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 EA No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 EA No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Pencco, Inc 1 EA No Bid

Rowell Chemical 1 EA No Bid

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 EA No Bid

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
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[ 9 [Pebble Quicklime

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON $200.00 $200.00 Graymont 1100
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON $365.61 $365.61 CARMEUSE LIME, INC. CARMEUSE LIME, INC.
Pencco, Inc 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 TON No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
| 10 |Pebb|e Quicklime- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR $125.00 $125.00 Graymont 1100
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR $150.00 $150.00 CARMEUSE LIME, INC. CARMEUSE LIME, INC.
Pencco, Inc 1 HR No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 HR No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 HR No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 HR No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 HR No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
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[ 11 [soda Ash
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
$367.00/short ton, fixed, all-in
delivered pricing for the entire
term of the contract. No
demurrage will be charged, no
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 TON $367.00 $367.00 energy surcharges shall apply. Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC XXXXXX

Soda Ash Dense - NSF, 7-10 day
lead time, 35-36-ton loadsl|f
smaller load needed, 23-25 tons, American Soda LLC, A Wholly Owned

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON $400.00 $400.00 unit price needs to be $410/ton  Subsidiary of Solvay SODA SOLVAY® DENSE
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 TON $421.00 $421.00 Minimum Order: 23.5 tons Tata Chemicals North America, Inc. Tata Chemicals North America, Inc.
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 TON No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
| 12 |Soda Ash- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
American Soda LLC, A Wholly Owned
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR $0.00 $0.00 No Charge Subsidiary of Solvay SODA SOLVAY® DENSE
Thatcher Company, Inc. 1 HR $150.00 $150.00 Tata Chemicals North America, Inc. Tata Chemicals North America, Inc.
Sisecam Chemicals Resources LLC 1 HR No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 HR No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 HR No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 HR No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 HR No Bid
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