

Detailed Bid Tab for ITB# 4505 - Swimming Pool Chemicals

Bidder	B&B		Northwest Pools		Leslie		PVS Nolwood	
	Unit	total	Unit	total	Unit	total	Unit	total
240 x 50lb buckets of Calcium Hypochlorite tablets	\$ 115.50	\$ 27,720.00	\$ 110.80	\$ 26,592.00	\$ 129.95	\$ 31,188.00	No Bid	
5 x Chlorine feeder	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 24,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	
10 x 50 lb bag of 83-87% pure calcium chloride	\$ 27.50	\$ 275.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 19.95	\$ 199.50	\$ 0.55	\$ 275.00
10 x 50lb bag of sodium bicarbonate	\$ 34.00	\$ 340.00	\$ 20.50	\$ 205.00	\$ 16.95	\$ 169.50	\$ 0.69	\$ 345.00
30 x 35 kg bags of Isocyanuric Acid	\$ 180.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 89.50	\$ 2,685.00	\$ 114.95	\$ 1,609.30	No Bid	
40 x 25lb bukets of Granular Calcium Hypochlorite w/ 68% available chlorine for shock	\$ 79.00	\$ 3,160.00	\$ 75.50	\$ 3,020.00	\$ 44.95	\$ 1,798.00	No Bid	
Total		\$ 60,895.00		\$ 34,682.00		\$ 34,964.30		\$ 620.00
Notes	Pulsar system				14 x 100lb Isocyanuric Acid		Per lb price	