

Detailed Bid Tab for ITB# 4500 - Operating Materials - Aggregates and Spoils Haul Out

Item Description	Approximate Annual Quantity	Farmer Material	Farmer Freight	Farmer Additional Freight Frost	Osburn Material	Osburn Freight	Osburn Additional Freight Frost	Levy Material	Levy Freight	Levy Additional Freight Frost
MDOT 21aa Limestone	4500 tons	9.00	4.56	6.84	9.15	4.90	0	12.45	5.4	No Bid
MDOT 3" x 1" Course Aggregate	300 tons	9.45	4.56	6.84	9.70	4.90	0	13.95	5.4	No Bid
4" x 8" Limestone Rip Rap	250 tons	18.20	4.56	6.84	13.90	4.90	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8" x 16" Limestone Rip Rap	50 tons	19.43	4.86	7.29	19.50	7.00	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16" x 24" Limestone Rip Rap	50 tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	26.50	7.00	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18" x 24" Limestone Rip Rap	50 tons	19.43	5.21	7.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6A MDOT Limestone Washed	500 tons	20.30	5.21	7.81	10.75	4.90	0	18.95	5.96	No Bid
84SK	3 tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2MS Masonry Sand	50 tons	6.94	5.21	7.81	8.00	7.25	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2NS Sand	1500 tons	5.51	4.56	6.84	5.60	4.90	0	8.65	4.84	No Bid
Topsoil	350 tons	7.36 Per Yard	6.25 Per Yard	9.38	9.00	6.00	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Class II Sand	5000 tons	2.89	5.21	7.81	3.50	6.00	0	3.5	4.84	No Bid
Spoils Haul Out	6500 tons		6.50	FU Dump		7.50		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Concrete Haul Out	As Needed		8.00	FU Dump		7.50		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Street Sweepings	As Needed		6.50	FU Dump	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Asphalt Haul Out	As Needed		6.50	FU Dump		7.50		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid