Supplier Scoring Summary 202602123901 Addendum 1 - 2026-2027 Chemical Consortium - Scoring Rounc
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35.00 30.00 12.86 5.71
15.00 20.00 10.00 6.43

7.50 20.00 11.43 5.00
5.00 17.50 8.57 4.29
15.63 21.88 10.71 5.36

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc.
Alexander Chemical Corporation
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc.
Rowell Chemical
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35.00 35.00 20.00 10.00

27.50 20.00 11.43 5.71
17.50 17.50 10.00

PVS Technologies, Inc.
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.

22.50 18.75 10.71
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35.00 35.00 20.00 10.00

26.25 26.25 16.25 6.25
438 10.94 7.50

Graymont Western Lime Inc
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc.

15.31 18.59 11.88




| 1 |Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon)

Supplier

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc.

Alexander Chemical
Corporation

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc.

Rowell Chemical

DuBois Chemicals, Inc.
Graymont Western Lime Inc
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc.
PVS Technologies, Inc.
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.
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Estimate
uom d

GAL

GAL

GAL

GAL
GAL
GAL
GAL
GAL
GAL

Price

$1.45

$1.695

$1.90

$1.99
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$1.45 gals/del

$1.99 load fee.

Supplier Notes Manufacturer
$2.70 for 1,000-1,999
gals/del$1.90 for 2,000-
2,999 gals/delS1.60 for
3,000-3,999 gals/del$1.50
for 4,000-4,499
gals/del$1.45 for 4,500+ JCI JONES

CHEMICALS

for full truckload deliveries Alexander
of 4,500 gal. for 3,000 gal Chemical

$1.70 $2.03. for 2,000 gal $2.36 Corporation

Pricing is based on full
truckload and the Owosso
Site falls under that
minimum order so the
price would be:
$1.95/gallon for 2,000 gal

$1.90 delivery Olin

Short loads will be $2.50
per gallon plus $500 short

Rowell Chemical

Manufacturer #

1201001

63300-10201000

100090

hypo-15-rc-b
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| 2 |Sodium Hypochlorite Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Estimate Price Extended
Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
JCI JONES
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR $75.00 $75.00 CHEMICALS N/A
Rowell Chemical 1 HR $75.00 $75.00 Rowell Chemical demurrage
Alexander

Alexander Chemical Demurrage fee starts after Chemical 63300-
Corporation 1 HR $100.00 $100.00 2 hours. Corporation 102010000

After 2 hours: Demurrage

$150.00/hour billed in

quarter hour increments

after 2 hours.

Weekend/Holiday Charges
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR $150.00 $150.00 $1,000.00 minimum Olin 100090
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

| 3 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- 40,000 Ibs. minimum shipments
Estimate Price Extended

Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Alexander Chemical
Corporation 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
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| 4 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- 30,000 Ibs. minimum shipments

Estimate Price Extended

Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Alexander Chemical

Corporation 1 TON No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

| 5 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- multiple locations in 40,000 Ibs. minimum shipments

Estimate Price Extended

Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Alexander Chemical

Corporation 1 TON No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
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| 6 |Hydrofluosi|ic Acid- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Estimate Price Extended
Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Alexander Chemical
Corporation 1 HR No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 HR No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
| 7 |Ferric Chloride- Dry Tons
Estimate Price Extended
Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
PVS
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON $1,138.00 $1,138.00 Technologies, Inc. No Alternative
Kemira Water
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON $1,257.00 $1,257.00 price per dry ton Solution, Inc. Kemira PIX-311
Alexander Chemical
Corporation 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
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| 8 |Ferric Chloride-Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Estimate Price Extended
Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
$125.00 an hour. After PVS
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 EA $125.00 $125.00 first 4 hours Technologies, Inc. No Alternative
Kemira Water
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 EA $150.00 $150.00 rate per hour Solutions, Inc. Demurrage
Alexander Chemical
Corporation 1 EA No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 EA No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 EA No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
| 9 [Pebble Quicklime
Estimate .
Supplier QTY UuUOM d Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON $210.00 $210.00 Graymont 1100
CARMEUSE LIME, CARMEUSE LIME,
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON $576.90 $576.90 INC. INC.
Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Alexander Chemical
Corporation 1 TON No Bid
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
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| 10 |Pebb|e Quicklime- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Estimate Price Extended

Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR $125.00 $125.00 Graymont 1100
CARMEUSE LIME, CARMEUSE LIME,

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR $150.00 $150.00 INC. INC.

Rowell Chemical 1 HR No Bid

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Alexander Chemical

Corporation 1 HR No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

| 11 [soda Ash
Estimate .

Supplier QTY UuUOM d Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Sisecam
Wyoming LLC/  Sisecam Soda Ash
DuBois / Sodium

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON $395.00 $395.00 Chemicals, Inc.  Carbonate

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Alexander Chemical

Corporation 1 TON No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 TON No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

Rowell Chemical 1 TON No Bid
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| 12 |Soda Ash- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Estimate Price Extended

Supplier QTY UOM d Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Sisecam
Wyoming LLC/  Sisecam Soda Ash
DuBois / Sodium

DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR $0.00 $0.00 No Charge Chemicals, Inc.  Carbonate

Alexander Chemical

Corporation 1 HR No Bid

JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid

Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Rowell Chemical 1 HR No Bid

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
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