
BID TABULATION 
FOR ONE 2008 COMPACT CAR 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
           
 
Buff Whelan Chevrolet     
Oakland County – Chevrolet Bid       $12,780.50 
Estimated 5.3 ton of greenhouse gas emissions     
and $1,348.00 annual fuel cost**       
 
Red Holman Pontiac-GMC 
Oakland County – GMC Bid       $15,191.00 
Estimated 5.6 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $1,409.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
Golling Chrysler-Jeep 
Oakland County – Dodge Bid       $12,735.00 
Estimated 5.6 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $1,409.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
 
Varsity Ford/Macomb County        $12,490.00* 
Estimated 4.9 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $1,240.00 annual fuel cost** 
            
State of Michigan         No Bid 
 
 
 
*Lowest Responsible Bidder 
 
** Based on 10,000 annual miles at 90% city and 10% highway and $3.10 per gallon 
fuel cost 



BID TABULATION 
FOR ONE 2008 ¾ TON, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE PICKUP 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
           
 
Buff Whelan Chevrolet 
Oakland County – Chevrolet Bid       $20,367.00 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions     
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost**       
 
Red Holman Pontiac-GMC 
Oakland County – GMC Bid       $20,296.00 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
Varsity Ford/ Macomb County Bid       $20,280.00* 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
State of Michigan         No Bid 
 
        
 
 
 
*Lowest Responsible Bidder 
 
** Based on 10,000 annual miles at 90% city and 10% highway and $3.10 per gallon 
fuel cost 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
BID TABULATION 

FOR ONE 2008 ¾ TON, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE, EXTENDED CAB PICKUP 
THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 
 

 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
           
 
Buff Whelan Chevrolet 
Oakland County – Chevrolet Bid       $22,587.00 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions     
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost**       
 
Red Holman Pontiac-GMC 
Oakland County – GMC Bid       $22,245.00 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
Varsity Ford/ Macomb County Bid       $22,176.00* 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
State of Michigan         No Bid 
 
        
 
 
 
*Lowest Responsible Bidder 
 
** Based on 10,000 annual miles at 90% city and 10% highway and $3.10 per gallon 
fuel cost 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
FOR ONE 2008 ¾ TON, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE PICKUP WITH POWER WINDOWS 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
           
 
Buff Whelan Chevrolet 
Oakland County – Chevrolet Bid       $23,312.00 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions     
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost**       
 
Red Holman Pontiac-GMC 
Oakland County – GMC Bid       $21,459.00 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
Varsity Ford/ Macomb County Bid       $20,810.00* 
Estimated 9.4 ton of greenhouse gas emissions 
and $2,385.00 annual fuel cost** 
 
State of Michigan         No Bid 
 
        
 
 
 
*Lowest Responsible Bidder 
 
** Based on 10,000 annual miles at 90% city and 10% highway and $3.10 per gallon 
fuel cost 
 



BID TABULATION 
FOR ONE 2008 SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE  
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
           
 
Varsity Ford/ Macomb County Bid       $19,071.00* 
 
Oakland County          No Bid 
 
State of Michigan         No Bid 
 
        
 
 
 
*Lowest Responsible Bidder 
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