

Bidder	Packer Body	Chassis	Delivery in Days	Computer & Software	Training	Included
Bell Equipment Company	Heil	Mack	120 (For First Truck) ARO	\$3,000.00 (Mack)	No Charge	Meal and Material
PACKER BODY DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS						
			Price Each	Quantity Needed	Total	(CNG Option per truck)
	<i>Side Loader, Single Arm</i>		\$254,500.00	8	\$2,036,000.00	\$33,257.00
	<i>Side Loader, Dual Arm</i>		No Bid	2	NO BID	
			Grand Total		\$2,036,000.00	

Bidder	Packer Body	Chassis	Delivery in Days	Computer & Software	Training	Included
Fredrickson Supply #1	Labrie	Mack	200 - 220 ARO	2 Year Software ONLY	No Charge	No indicated
LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER						
			Price Each	Quantity Needed	Total	(CNG Option per truck)
	<i>Side Loader, Single Arm</i>		\$278,443.00	8	\$2,227,544.00	\$31,607.00
	<i>Side Loader, Dual Arm</i>		\$302,425.00	2	\$604,850.00	\$31,607.00
			Grand Total		\$2,832,394.00	

Bidder	Packer Body	Chassis	Delivery in Days	Computer & Software	Training	Included
Fredrickson Supply #2	Labrie	Autocar	200 - 220 ARO	No Charge	No Charge	No indicated
			Price Each	Quantity Needed	Total	(CNG Option per truck)
	<i>Side Loader, Single Arm</i>		\$297,678.00	8	\$2,381,424.00	\$32,719.00
	<i>Side Loader, Dual Arm</i>		\$328,150.00	2	\$656,300.00	\$32,719.00
			Grand Total		\$3,037,724.00	

Bidder	Packer Body	Chassis	Delivery in Days	Computer & Software	Training	Included
Great Lakes Service Center, LLC #	McNeilus	Autocar	None provided	\$4,000.00	\$1,000.00	Lodging, Meals & Material
PACKER BODY DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS						
			Price Each	Quantity Needed	Total	(CNG Option per truck)
	<i>Side Loader, Single Arm</i>		\$268,175.00	8	\$2,145,400.00	<i>Not Available</i>
	<i>Side Loader, Dual Arm</i>		No Bid	2	NO BID	
			Grand Total		\$2,145,400.00	

Bidder	Packer Body	Chassis	Delivery in Days	Computer & Software	Training	Included
Great Lakes Service Center, LLC #	Heil	Autocar	None provided	\$4,000.00	\$1,000.00	Lodging, Meals & Material
PACKER BODY DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS						
NOTE: Bidder MUST be authorized by the Packer Body Manufacture t make any and all Warranty repairs (Great Lakes may not qualify to bid Heil bodies)						
			Price Each	Quantity Needed	Total	(CNG Option per truck)
	<i>Side Loader, Single Arm</i>		\$286,675.00	8	\$2,293,400.00	\$33,257.00
	<i>Side Loader, Dual Arm</i>		No Bid	2	NO BID	
			Grand Total		\$2,293,400.00	