
1
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 GAL $2.05 $2.05

1,000-1,999 gals/del $3.55/gal*2,000-2,999 gals/del $2.60/gal*3,000-3,999 
gals/del $2.25/gal*4,000-4,499 gals/del $2.10/gal*4,500+ gals/del $2.05/gal* 
*Prices are subject to change Quarterly upon 30 days written notice.

Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 GAL $2.29 $2.29
PRICING IS FIRM CALENDAR QUARTERLY ONLY!PRICING IS BASED ON FULL 
TANKER TRUCK DELIVERIES.

Rowell Chemical 1 GAL $2.41 $2.41
Haviland Products Company 1 GAL $2.80 $2.80 price is good until 12/31/23
Pencco, Inc 1 GAL No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 GAL No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 GAL No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 GAL No Bid

2
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 HR $0.00 $0.00
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 HR $75.00 $75.00 DEMURRAGE FEE STARTS AFTER 2 HOURS.
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR $75.00 $75.00
Rowell Chemical 1 HR $100.00 $100.00
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 HR No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 HR No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 HR No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 HR No Bid

3
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 ton $0.00 $0.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 ton $523.00 $523.00 40,000 lbs minimum shipments as bid reads

Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 ton $582.00 $582.00
40,000 LBS MINIMUM. ***SEE MULTIPLE LOCATION LINE #5 PRICING 
($100.00 MULTI STOP FEE)***

Pencco, Inc 1 ton $738.00 $738.00
Rowell Chemical 1 ton No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 ton No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 ton No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon)

Sodium Hypochlorite Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Hydrofluosilic Acid- 40,000 lbs. minimum shipments
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4
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 ton $0.00 $0.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 ton $550.00 $550.00 30,000 lbs minimum shipments as bid reads
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 ton $610.00 $610.00 MINIMUM 30,000 LBS - 39,999 LBS
Pencco, Inc 1 ton $820.00 $820.00
Rowell Chemical 1 ton No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 ton No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 ton No Bid

5
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 ton $0.00 $0.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 ton $523.00 $523.00 40,000 lbs minimum shipments as bid reads
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 ton $582.00 $582.00 40,000 LBS MINIMUM - $100.00 MULTI STOP FEE
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 ton No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 ton No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 ton No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid

6
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 hr $0.00 $0.00
Haviland Products Company 1 hr $0.00 $0.00
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 hr $75.00 $75.00 DEMURRAGE FEE STARTS AFTER 2 HOURS.
Pencco, Inc 1 hr $100.00 $100.00 1 Stop included, 2 hours free, $100/hr thereafter
Rowell Chemical 1 hr No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 hr No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 hr No Bid

Hydrofluosilic Acid- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Hydrofluosilic Acid- 30,000 lbs. minimum shipments

Hydrofluosilic Acid- multiple locations in 40,000 lbs. minimum shipments
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7
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 ton $0.00 $0.00
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 ton $1,150.00 $1,150.00
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 ton $1,389.61 $1,389.61 PRICING BASED OFF OF DRY TONS, AND FULL TRUCK LOADS.
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 ton No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 ton No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 ton No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 ton No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid

8
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 ton $1,258.00 $1,258.00 6 months firm-Max 5% increase

Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 ton $1,445.70 $1,445.70
PRICING BASED OFF OF DRY TONS, AND PARTIAL TRUCK LOADS. MINIMUM 
ORDER OF 3,000 GALLONS.

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 ton $1,150.00 per dry ton. Liquid Ferric Chloride 37-42%
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 ton No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 ton No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 ton No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 ton No Bid

9
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 hr $0.00 $0.00
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 hr $125.00 $125.00
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 hr $200.00 $200.00 DEMURRAGE FEE STARTS AFTER 2 HOURS.
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 hr No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 hr No Bid
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
Pencco, Inc 1 hr No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 hr No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 hr No Bid

Ferric Chloride- Dry

Ferric Chloride-Liquid

Ferric Chloride-Demurrage (first 4 hours free)
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10
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 ton $0.00 $0.00
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 ton $148.00 $148.00
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 ton $172.00 $172.00
Pencco, Inc 1 ton No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 ton No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 ton No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 ton No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 ton No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 ton No Bid

11
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Haviland Products Company 1 hr $0.00 $0.00
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc. 1 hr $90.00 $90.00
Graymont Western Lime Inc 1 hr $100.00 $100.00
Pencco, Inc 1 hr No Bid
Rowell Chemical 1 hr No Bid
DuBois Chemicals, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc 1 hr No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation 1 hr No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1 hr No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 hr No Bid

Pebble Quicklime- Demurrage (first 4 hours free)

Pebble Quicklime
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