Detailed Bid Tab for ITB# 4588 - Water Main Line Stops and Insertable Valves

Watertap Inc Culy Contracting LLC
W.ater Main Estlmail:ed Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal
Line Stops Quantity
4" 2 $ 2,600.00 [$ 5,20000|S 5,750.00 | $ 11,500.00
6” 2 $ 2,800.00 |$ 5,600.00|S 5,750.00 S 11,500.00
8” 10 $ 3,300.00 |$ 33,000.00|S$ 5,750.00 | $ 57,500.00
10” 2 S 4,500.00 |$ 9,000.00|S 7,500.00 (S 15,000.00
12” 6 $ 4,800.00 [$ 28,800.00|S$ 7,500.00 | S 45,000.00
14” 2 $ 7,900.00 |$ 15,800.00| S 9,500.00 | $ 19,000.00
16” 4 $ 8,400.00 [$ 33,600.00| S 9,900.00 | $ 39,600.00
20” 1 $ 11,000.00 |$ 11,000.00 | $ 12,950.00 | $ 12,950.00
24" 1 $ 17,000.00 [ $ 17,000.00 | $ 16,225.00 | $ 16,225.00
30” 1 $ 26,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $27,750.00 | $ 27,750.00
Line Stop Totals] $ 185,000.00 S  256,025.00
Insertable Estimated L L
) Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal
Valves Quantity
4" 1 $ 4,840.00 [$ 4,84000|S 8,775.00 | $ 8,775.00
6” 4 S 4,650.00 |$ 18,600.00| S 9,235.00 | $ 36,940.00
8” 2 $ 5,490.00 [$ 10,980.00 | $ 10,250.00 | $ 20,500.00
10” 1 S 8,480.00 |S 8,480.00 | $ 19,900.00 | $ 19,900.00
12” 1 $ 9,240.00 |$ 9,240.00 | $ 22,010.00 | $ 22,010.00
Insertable Valve Totals| S 52,140.00 $ 108,125.00
$

Estimated Total Cost $ 237,140.00

364,150.00

Watertap Inc Culy Contracting LLC
Emergenc:y R.esponse Estlma?ed Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal
Water Main Line Stops Quantity
q4” 1]$ 2,600.00 [$ 2,600.00 | No Bid 0
6” 1S 2,800.00 [$ 2,800.00 ] No Bid 0
8” 5|$ 3,300.00 | $ 16,500.00 | No Bid 0
10” 1S 4,500.00 [$ 4,500.00 ] No Bid 0
12” 3]$ 4,800.00 | S 14,400.00] No Bid 0
14” 1]$ 7,900.00 [$ 7,900.00 ] No Bid 0
16” 2|$ 8,400.00 | S 16,800.00] No Bid 0
20” 1] $ 11,000.00 [$ 11,000.00] No Bid 0
24” 1] $ 17,000.00 [$ 17,000.00] No Bid 0
30” 1] $ 26,000.00 [ $ 26,000.00 | No Bid 0
Emergency Response Line Stop Totals| $ 119,500.00 0
Emergency Response EStlmaTed Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal
Insertable Valves Quantity
q4” 1 S 4,840.00 |S 4,840.00 | No Bid 0
6” 2 $ 4,650.00 [S 9,300.00] No Bid 0
8” 1 $ 5,490.00 | $ 5,490.00 | No Bid 0
10” 1 S 8,480.00 [S 8,480.00 ] No Bid 0
12” 1 S 9,240.00 |$ 9,240.00 | No Bid 0
Emergency Response Insertable Valve Totals] $ 37,350.00 0
0

Estimated Total Cost $ 156,850.00



