BID TABULATION

Project:  Utility Infrastructure Materials
Bid Date: Wednesday, November 07, 2018
ITB: ITB #4554
Core and Main LP EJ USA, Inc.
Item Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  [Extended Price
GROUP 1: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
1 BEND, 12" 22 1/2 DEGREE MJ EA 0o |$ 206.35 | $ - $ i
2 BEND, 16" 22 1/2 DEGREE MJ EA o |$ 407.33 | ¢ - $ B
3 BEND, 20" 22 1/2 DEGREE MJ EA 0o |$ 678.68 | $ - $ B
4 BEND, 8" 45 DEGREE MJ EA o |$ 11751 | - $ _
5 BEND, 12" 45 DEGREE MJ EA 0o |$ 226.45 | $ - $ -
6 BEND, 16" 45 DEGREE MJ EA o |$ 420.09 | ¢ - $ B
7 TEE, 4", MJ EA 0o |$ 9454 | ¢ - $ -
8 TEE, 6", MJ EA o |$ 149.42 | - $ -
9 TEE, 8", MJ EA 2 $ 22187 | ¢ 443.74 $ -
10 TEE, 12", MJ EA 0o |$ 368.85 | $ - $ B
11 TEE, 6" x 4", MJ EA 0o |$ 137.96 | $ - $ -
12 TEE, 8" x 6", MJ EA 2 $ 175.05 | $ 350.10 $ -
13 TEE, 12" x 4", MJ EA 0o |$ 250.86 | $ - $ B
14 TEE, 12" x 6", MJ EA 2 $ 268.52 | $ 537.04 $ -
15 PLUG, 4" MJ EA 1 |s 2713 | g 27.13 $ -
16 PLUG, 6" MJ EA 1 |$ 4710 | ¢ 47.10 $ -
17 PLUG, 8" MJ EA 1 |$ 67.56 | $ 67.56 $ -
18 PLUG, 12" MJ EA 1 |3 106.06 | $ 106.06 $ -
19 PLUG, 16" MJ EA 1 |3 25712 | $ 257.12 $ -
20 REDUCER, 4" X 3", MJ x MJ EA 1 |3 58.64 | ¢ 58.64 $ -
21 REDUCER, 6" X 4", MJ x MJ EA 0o |$ 70.76 | $ - $ -
22 REDUCER, 8" X 6", MJ x MJ EA 2 | s 94.26 | $ 188.52 $ -
23 REDUCER, 12" X 6", MJ x MJ EA 0o |$ 175.74 | ¢ - $ -
24 REDUCER, 12" X 10", MILEB x PE EA 0o |$ 157.49 | $ - $ -
25 REDUCER, 16" X 12", MJ x MJ EA 0o |$ 290.05 | $ - $ -
26 REDUCER, 20" X 12", PE x MJSEB EA o |$ 466.67 | ¢ - $ N
27 CAP, 4" MJ EA 1 |3 29.07 | $ 29.07 $ -
28 CAP, 6" MJ EA 1 |$ 4517 | ¢ 45.17 $ -
29 CAP, 8" MJ EA 1 |$ 63.40 | ¢ 63.40 $ -
30 CAP, 10" MJ EA 1 |3 84.14 | ¢ 84.14 $ -
31 CAP, 12" MJ EA 1 |$ 11110 | 111.10 $ -
32 SLEEVE, SOLID 4"x12" DUAL PURPOSE EA 2 $ 206.98 | $ 413.96 $ -
33 SLEEVE, SOLID 6"x12" DUAL PURPOSE EA 8 | $ 179.84 | $ 1,438.72 $ -
34 SLEEVE, SOLID 8"x12" DUAL PURPOSE EA 4 |3 230.21 | $ 920.84 $ -
35 SLEEVE, SOLID 10"x12" DUAL PURPOSE EA 1 |$ 290.99 | g 290.99 $ -
36 SLEEVE, SOLID 12"x12" DUAL PURPOSE EA 0o |$ 629.36 | $ - $ ;
37 SLEEVE, SOLID 4" MJ SHORT EA 5 | $ 53.49 | g 267.45 $ -
38 SLEEVE, SOLID 4" MJ LONG EA 5 | $ 63.55 | $ 317.75 $ -
39 SLEEVE, SOLID 6" MJ SHORT EA 9 |$ 7427 | $ 668.43 $ -
40 SLEEVE, SOLID 6" MJ LONG EA 5 | $ 96.14 | $ 480.70 $ -
41 SLEEVE, SOLID 8" MJ SHORT EA 5 |$ 100.64 | $ 503.20 $ -
42 SLEEVE, SOLID 8" DI MJ LONG EA 10 |$ 13530 | $ 1,353.00 $ -
43 SLEEVE, SOLID 10" MJ SHORT EA 4 |$ 163.63 | $ 654.52 $ ;
44 SLEEVE, SOLID 10" MJ LONG EA 1 |$ 150.96 | $ 150.96 $ -
45 SLEEVE, SOLID 12" MJ SHORT EA 4 |3 178.12 | 712.48* $ -
46 SLEEVE, SOLID 12" MJ LONG EA 2 $ 188.88 | ¢ 377.76 $ -
47 SLEEVE, SOLID 14" MJ SHORT EA 2 $ 307.67 | $ 615.34 $ -
48 SLEEVE, SOLID 14" MJ LONG EA 2 $ 32042 | ¢ 640.84 $ -
49 SLEEVE, SOLID 16" MJ SHORT EA o |$ 36752 | $ - $ _
50 SLEEVE, SOLID 16" MJ LONG EA 1 |$ 388.77 | $ 388.77 $ -
51 SLEEVE, SOLID 20" MJ SHORT EA 4 |3 580.88 | $ 2,323.52 $ -
52 SLEEVE, SOLID 20" MJ LONG EA 0o |$ 612.58 | $ - $ _
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BID TABULATION

Project:  Utility Infrastructure Materials
Bid Date: Wednesday, November 07, 2018
ITB: ITB #4554
Core and Main LP EJ USA, Inc.

Item Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  [Extended Price
53 SLEEVE, SOLID 24" MJ SHORT EA 2 $ 784.23 | $ 1,568.46 $ -
54 SLEEVE, SOLID 24" MJ LONG EA 2 $ 823.28 | $ 1,646.56 $ -
55 SLEEVE, SOLID 30" MJ SHORT EA 1 $ 1,499.01 | $ 1,499.01 $ -

GROUP 1 SUBTOTAL $  19,649.15* $ -
Unlisted Ductile Iron Fittings Percent Discount from List Price 25%)
GROUP 2: DUCTILE IRON MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT GLANDS
56 GLAND, 4" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 5 $ 26.16 | $ 130.80 $ -
57 GLAND, 6" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 13 $ 3255 | ¢ 423.15 $ -
58 GLAND, 8" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 13 $ 4341 | ¢ 564.33 $ -
59 GLAND, 10" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 2 $ 63.26 | $ 126.52 $ -
60 GLAND, 12" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 2 $ 84.48 | ¢ 168.96 $ -
61 GLAND, 16" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 0 $ 14991 | ¢ - $ _
62 GLAND, 20" MJ JOINT RESTRAINT EA 0 $ 396.79 | $ - $ -
GROUP 2 SUBTOTAL $ 1,413.76 $ -
Unlisted Mechanical Joint Restraint Glands Percent Discount from List Price 25%
GROUP 3: DUCTILE IRON PIPE
63 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 4" EA 2 $ 16.08 | $ 643.20 $ -
64 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 6" EA 3 $ 11.87 | $ 712.20 $ -
65 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 8" EA 1 $ 16.41 | 328.20 $ -
66 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 10" EA 1 $ 20.05 | $ 401.00 $ -
67 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 12" EA 1 $ 2572 | $ 514.40 $ -
68 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 16" EA 0 $ 4149 | ¢ - $ -
69 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 20" EA 1 $ 57.41 | $ 1,148.20 $ -
70 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 24" EA 1 $ 77.46 | $ 1,549.20 $ -
71 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON 30" EA 1 $ 126.68 | $ 2,533.60 $ -
GROUP 3 SUBTOTAL $ 7,830.00 $ _
Unlisted Ductile Iron Pipe Percent Discount from List Price NA
**Core and Main provided per lineal foot pipe pricing in lieu of the requested per section price.
GROUP 4: FIRE HYDRANTS
72 EJ 5BR250 FIRE HYDRANT, 5.5' BURY EA 5 $ 198730 (s 9,936.50 | $  2,070.68 [ $  10,353.40
73 EJ 5BR250 FIRE HYDRANT, 6' BURY EA 5 $ 202425|$ 10,421.25| $ 210918 | $ 10,545.90
74 EJ 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION, SHAFT ONLY EA 13 | $ 45.70 | ¢ 594.10 | $ 48.69 | 632.97
75 EJ 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION, SHAFT ONLY EA 13 | $ 45.25 | ¢ 588.25 | $ 48.20 | ¢ 626.60
76 EJ 6BR 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT EA 5 | $ 231.00 | $ 1,155.00 | $ 246.05 | $ 1,230.25
77 EJ 6BR 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT EA 5 $ 270.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 287.67 | ¢ 1,438.35
78 EJ 5BR250 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT EA 8 $ 270.00 | $ 2,160.00 | $ 287.67 | ¢ 2,301.36
79 EJ 5BR250 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT EA 8 | $ 231.00 | $ 1,848.00 | $ 246.05 | $ 1,968.40
80 EJ 6BR CONVERSION CHATTER KIT EA 8 $ 32780 | $ 262240 | $ 349.21 | $ 2,793.68
EJ 5BR CONVERSION KIT FOR TRAVERSE CITY
81 HYDRANT EA 5 $ 2,382.00($ 1191000| $ 2,482.02|$ 12,410.10
82 EJ 5BR250 BRK FLG REPAIR KIT, BLACK #00946447 EA 8 $ 107.90 | $ 863.20 | $ 11493 | $ 919.44
83 EJ BR BRK FLG REPAIR KIT, RED #00946345 EA 8 $ 107.90 | $ 863.20 | $ 114.93 | $ 919.44
84 EJ 6BR VALVE SEAT EA 10 $ 50.50 | $ 505.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 540.00
85 EJ 6BR VALVE SEAT O RINGS EA 10 $ 840 | $ 84.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 90.00
86 EJ 6BR DRIP SHUT OFF EA 10 $ 85.60 | $ 856.00 | $ 91.20 | $ 912.00
87 EJ 6BR VALVE WASHER EA 10 $ 20.40 | $ 204.00 | $ 21.77 | $ 217.70
88 EJ 5BR250 VALVE SEAT EA 10 $ 51.75 | $ 517.50 | $ 55.35 | $ 553.50
89 EJ 5BR VALVE SEAT O RINGS EA 10 $ 445 | ¢ 4450 $ 479 | $ 47.90
90 EJ 5BR DRIP SHUT OFF EA 10 $ 82.45 | $ 824.50 | $ 87.87 | $ 878.70
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BID TABULATION

Project:  Utility Infrastructure Materials
Bid Date: Wednesday, November 07, 2018
ITB: ITB #4554
Core and Main LP EJ USA, Inc.
Item Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  [Extended Price
91 EJ 5BR VALVE WASHER EA 10 $ 2040 | $ 20400 | $ 2177 | $ 217.70
92 HARRINGTON 4" STORZ NOZZLE CAP F/4-1/2" PORT | EA 5 $ 127.80 | $ 639.00 | $ 333.00 | $ 1,665.00
GROUP 4 SUBTOTAL $  47,890.40* $ 51,262.39
Unlisted Fire Hydrant Parts Discount from List Price NA 10%
*Calculated Bid Amounts do not Match Written Bid
GROUP 5: GATE VALVES
93 GATE VALVE, 4" MJ EA 2 $ 391.84 | $ 78368 | $ 408.32 | $ 816.64
94 GATE VALVE, 6" MJ EA 8 $ 513.13 | $ 4,105.04 | $ 514.10 | $ 4,112.80
95 GATE VALVE, 8" MJ EA 1 $ 788.78 | $ 788.78 | $ 827.77 | $ 827.77
96 GATE VALVE, 8" MJ x TAP EA 1 $ 991.96 | $ 991.96 | $ 1,077.41 | $ 1,077.41
97 GATE VALVE, 10" MJ EA 1 |$ 120808 |¢ 1,20808|% 129091 |$  1,290.91
98 GATE VALVE, 12" MJ EA 3 $ 1,521.95 | ¢ 456585 | $ 1,633.28 | $ 4,899.84
99 GATE VALVE, 14" MJ EA 1 $ 5,261.28 | $ 5,261.28 No Bid | $ -
100 GATE VALVE, 16" MJ EA 0 $ 4,936.08 | ¢ - $ 547511 | $ -
101 GATE VALVE, 20" MJ EA 1 $ 11,681.92 |$ 11,681.92| $ 13,041.77 | $ 13,041.77
102 STAINLESS TAPPING SLEEVE, 12"X12"X8" EA 1 $ 52591 | $ 525.91 No Bid | $ -
103 STAINLESS TAPPING SLEEVE, 16"X16"X8" EA 1 $ 918.40 | $ 918.40 No Bid | $ -
104 STAINLESS TAPPING SLEEVE, 20"X20"X8" EA 1 $ 1,232.96 | $ 1,232.96 No Bid | $ -
GROUP 5 SUBTOTAL $ 32,063.86 $ 26,067.14*
Unlisted Gate Valves Percent Discount from List Price 25%) 52.0%
GROUP 6: CURB AND GATE BOXES
105 CURB BOX, COMPLETE EA 150 $ 3448 | $ 5,172.00 $ -
106 CURB BOX, TOP HALF EA 50 $ 18.60 | $ 930.00 $ -
107 CURB BOX, LARGE BASE (BIGFOQOT) EA 25 $ 772 1% 193.00 $ -
108 CURB BOX EXTENSION, 9" EA 50 $ 6.81|$% 340.50 $ -
109 CURB BOX EXTENSION, 16" EA 50 $ 9.98 | $ 499.00 $ -
110 CURB BOX REPAIR LID EA 100 $ 13.00 | $ 1,300.00 $ -
111  [GATE BOX, COMPLETE EA 25 |'$ 10116 | $  2,529.00 $ -
112  [GATE BOX TOP 1/2, WITH LID EA 50 |$ 4400 |$  2,200.00 $ -
113 GATE BOX EXTENSION, 14" EA 25 $ 19.95 | 498.75 $ -
114 GATE BOX EXTENSION, 18" & 20" EA 25 $ 2314 | $ 578.50 $ -
115 |GATE BOX REGULAR BASE (#6) EA 25 | $ 3130 | 782.50 $ -
116  |GATE BOX SMALL BASE (#4) EA 5 | $ 1543 | g 385.75 $ -
117 GATE BOX FIXED RISER EA 50 $ 2042 | $ 1,021.00 $ -
118 GATE BOX ADJUSTABLE RISER EA 25 $ 2042 | $ 510.50 $ -
GROUP 6 SUBTOTAL $ 16,940.50 $ -
Unlisted Curb and Gate Boxes Percent Discount from List Price 40%)
GROUP 7: EXTENDED RANGE COUPLINGS
119 4” EXTENDED RANGE COUPLING EA 5 $ 12432 | 621.60 $ -
120 6” EXTENDED RANGE COUPLING EA 5 $ 171.93 | $ 859.65 $ -
121 8" EXTENDED RANGE COUPLING EA 5 $ 202.78 | $ 1,013.90 $ -
122 10" EXTENDED RANGE COUPLING EA 2 $ 25291 | ¢ 505.82 $ -
123 12" EXTENDED RANGE COUPLING EA 2 $ 328.30 | $ 656.60 $ -
GROUP 7 SUBTOTAL $ 3,657.57 $ -
Unlisted Extended Range Couplings Percent Discount from List Price 25%)
GROUP 8: COPPER PIPE
124 1" TYPE K COPPER, 60’ ROLL EA | 25 $ 405 (3 6,075.00 $ -
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BID TABULATION

Project:  Utility Infrastructure Materials
Bid Date: Wednesday, November 07, 2018
ITB: ITB #4554
Core and Main LP EJ USA, Inc.
Item Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  [Extended Price
125 1" TYPE K COPPER, 100’ ROLL EA 50 $ 4.05|$  20,250.00 $ -
126 1-1/2” TYPE K COPPER, 60’ ROLL EA 5 $ 6.34 | $ 1,902.00 $ -
127 2" TYPE K COPPER, 60’ ROLL EA 5 $ 10.08 | $ 3,024.00 $ -
GROUP 8 SUBTOTAL $ 31,251.00 $ S
Unlisted Copper Pipe Percent Discount from List Price NA
GROUP 9: BRASS FITTINGS
128 CORPORATION, 3/4" X 1" EA 10 $ 2854 | ¢ 285.40 $ -
129 CORPORATION, 1" EA 250 $ 3487 | $ 8,717.50 $ -
130 CORPORATION, 1" C-C X 1-1/4" FLR EA 10 $ 109.87 | ¢ 1,098.70 $ -
131 CORPORATION, 1-1/4" EA 0 $ 12341 | $ - $ -
132 CORPORATION, 1-1/2" EA 25 $ 146.03 | $ 3,650.75 $ -
133 CORPORATION, 1-1/2" C-C X 2" FLR EA 10 $ 17236 | $ 1,723.60 $ -
134 CORPORATION, 2" EA 25 $ 200.70 | $ 5,017.50 $ -
135 SADDLE, 6" X 1 1/2" EA 10 $ 9221 | $ 922.10 $ -
136 SADDLE, 8" X 1 1/2" EA 10 $ 105.09 | ¢ 1,050.90 $ -
137 SADDLE, 10" X 1 1/2" EA 10 $ 13580 | $ 1,358.00 $ -
138 SADDLE, 12" X 1 1/2" EA 10 $ 163.24 | ¢ 1,632.40 $ -
139 CURB STOP, 1" C-C EA 225 $ 69.51 | $ 15,639.75 $ -
140 CURB STOP, 1-1/4" C-C EA 0 $ 123.02 | $ - $ -
141 CURB STOP, 1-1/2" C-C EA 20 $ 17547 | $ 3,509.40 $ -
142 CURB STOP, 2" C-C EA 20 $ 276.50 | $ 5,530.00 $ -
143 STRAIGHT COUPLING, 3/4" X 3/4" FNPT X FFLR EA 20 $ 848 | $ 169.60 $ -
144 STRAIGHT COUPLING, 1" X 1" FNPT X FFLR EA 70 $ 1433 | $ 1,003.10 $ -
145 STRAIGHT COUPLING, 1-1/4" X 1-1/4" FNPT X FFLR EA 25 $ 2195 | g 548.75 $ -
146 STRAIGHT COUPLING, 1-1/2" X 1-1/2" FNPT X FFLR EA 25 $ 3051 | ¢ 762.75 $ -
147 STRAIGHT COUPLING, 2" X 2" FNPT X FFLR EA 15 $ 5228 | $ 784.20 $ -
148 TWO-PART UNION, 3/4" EA 50 $ 1155 | ¢ 577.50 $ -
149 TWO-PART UNION, 1" EA 100 $ 17.90 | $ 1,790.00 $ -
150 TWO-PART UNION, 1-1/4" EA 45 $ 3251 | % 1,462.95 $ -
151 TWO-PART UNION, 1-1/2" EA 20 $ 4315 | ¢ 863.00 $ -
152 TWO-PART UNION, 2" EA 10 $ 8345 | g 834.50 $ -
153 |1-1/2" TEE EA 10 [|$ 108.00 | $  1,080.00 $ -
154 2" TEE EA 10 $ 202.65 | $ 2,026.50 $ -
155 1-1/2” QUARTER BEND (90) 10 $ 98.12 [ $ 981.20 $ -
156 2" QUARTER BEND (90) 10 $ 135.24 [ $ 1,352.40 $ -
1" X 3/4" COPPER FLR X FFLR
157 (PIGGY BACK NUT) 25 $ 1574 | $ 393.50 $ -
158 1-1/4" X 1" COPPER FLR X FFLR (PIGGY BACK NUT) 20 $ 3184 | $ 636.80 $ -
1-1/2" X 1-1/4" COPPER FLR X FFLR (PIGGY BACK
159 NUT) 20 $ 56.54 | $ 1,130.80* $ -
160 2" X 1-1/2" COPPER FLR X FFLR (PIGGY BACK NUT) EA 10 N/A|$ - $ -
161 1-1/4" X 1-1/2" FFLR X COPPER FLR EA 10 $ 5457 | $ 545.70 $ -
GROUP 9 SUBTOTAL $ 67,079.25* $ -

Unlisted Brass Fittings Percent Discount from List Price

25%

*Calculated Bid Amounts do not Match Written Bid
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Project:  Utility Infrastructure Materials
Bid Date: Wednesday, November 07, 2018
ITB: ITB #4554

BID TABULATION

Core and Main LP EJ USA, Inc.

Item Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  [Extended Price

GROUP 10: WATER METER ACCESSORIES
162 |METER HORN, 3/4" X 1" X 1" EA 75 | $ 5338 |¢$  4,003.50 $ -
163 |METER HORN, 1" X 1" X 1" EA 25 | $ 85.90 | $ 2,147.50 $ -
164 |TANDEM RESETTER, 3/4" X 3/4" EA 5 | $ 159.88 | $ 799.40 $ -
165 |1-1/2" METER FLANGE, PAIR EA 25 | $ 21.63* ¢ 1,081.50 $ -
166  |2" METER FLANGE, PAIR EA 13 | $ 25.38*| ¢ 659.88 $ -
167 |METER ADAPTER, 5/8" X 3/4", PAIR EA 50 |$ 2.60%| $ 260.00 $ -
168 |PRESSURE REDUCING VALVE, 3/4" EA 2 |$ 58.29 | $ 116.58 $ -
169 |PRESSURE REDUCING VALVE, 1" EA 1 |$ 7292 | g 72.92 $ -
170 |PRESSURE REDUCING VALVE, 1-1/4" EA 1 |s 178.62 | $ 178.62 $ -
171  |PRESSURE REDUCING VALVE, 1-1/2" EA 1 |s 286.84 | $ 286.84 $ -
172  |PRESSURE REDUCING VALVE, 2" EA 1 |3 350.64 | $ 350.64 $ -
173 |REDUCED PRESSURE ZONE ASSEMBLY, 1" EA 3 | 260.30 | $ 780.90 $ -
174 |REDUCED PRESSURE ZONE ASSEMBLY, 2" EA 3 |s 533.75 | $ 1,601.25 $ -

GROUP 10 SUBTOTAL $ 12,339.53 $ -
Unlisted Water Meter Accessories Percent Discount from List Price 25%

*Submitted price unit price was per each. Adjusted total to match pair bid item.

GROUP 11: CASTINGS
175 |EJ 1040C COVER, SEWER EA 10 |$ 160.25 | $ 1,602.50 | $ 167.07 | $ 1,670.70
176  |EJ 1040C COVER, STORM EA 10 |$ 160.25 | $ 1,60250 | $ 167.07 | $ 1,670.70
177  |EJ 1040C COVER, WATER EA 10 |$ 160.25 | $ 1,60250 | $ 167.07 | $ 1,670.70
178  |EJ 1040AGS COVER, SEWER EA 25 | $ 19205 |$ 4,801.25| $ 200.21 | $ 5,005.25
179  |EJ 1040M1 GRATE EA 3 |$ 149.20 | $ 44760 | $ 15553 | $ 466.59
180 |EJ 1040Z FRAME EA 50 | $ 22375 |$ 11,18750| $ 23330 | $  11,665.00
181 |EJ 1046Z FRAME EA 5 | $ 194.75 | $ 973.75| $ 203.07 | $ 1,015.35
182  |EJ 1000C COVER, STORM EA 3 |3 150.80 | $ 45240 $ 157.28 | $ 471.84
183  |EJ 1000C COVER, SEWER EA 3 |3 150.80 | $ 45240 $ 157.28 | $ 471.84
184  |EJ 1000C COVER, WATER EA 3 |3 150.80 | $ 45240 $ 157.28 | $ 471.84
185 |EJ 1000Z FRAME EA 8 |3 200.85 | $ 1,606.80 | $ 209.39 | $ 1,675.12
186 |EJ 7045M1 CURB INLET GRATE EA 10 |$ 127.85 | 1,27850 | $ 13331 | $ 1,333.10
187 |EJ 7045Z CURB INLET FRAME EA 10 | $ 27150 | g 2,715.00 | $ 283.08 | $ 2,830.80
188  |EJ 7050T1 CURB INLET HOOD EA 10 | $ 104.85 | $ 1,04850 | $ 109.35 | $ 1,093.50
189 |EJ 7060T1 CURB INLET HOOD EA 3 |3 112.00 | $ 336.00 | $ 116.81 | $ 350.43
190 |EJ 5000M2 CATCH BASIN GRATE EA 1 |$ 122,10 | 122.10| $ 12732 | 127.32
191  |EJ 5080Z CATCH BASIN FRAME EA 1 |$ 22250 | g 22250 | $ 23215 | g 232.15
192  |EJ 5000Z CATCH BASIN FRAME EA 1 |s 168.10 | $ 168.10 | $ 17525 | $ 175.25

GROUP 11 SUBTOTAL $  31,072.30 $  32,397.48
Unlisted Castings Percent Discount from List Price 25%) N/A

GROUP 12: TRAVERSE CITY FIRE HYDRANT PARTS
193 |COPPER GASKETS-USED WITH #5 ONLY (1 XI) EA 0o |$ 14.80 | $ - $ -
194 |BRONZE STUD 1/2” (2 R) EA 0o |$ 2146 | $ - $ -
195 |BRONZE NUT 1/2” (3 R) EA o |s 221 | g - $ -
196 |CAST IRON TOP NUT (4 T) EA 0 |s 37.01 (% - $ -
197 |(5F) EA o |s 17321 | $ - $ -
198 |RUBBER O-RING SEALS-REQUIRES 2 (6 Y) EA o |s 221 | - $ -
199 |TOP BRONZE PIECE (7 U) EA o |s 51521 | ¢ B, $ _
200 |BRONZE HOSE NOZZLE 2% (9 G) EA o |s 204.30 | $ B, $ _
201 |HOSE NOZZLE CAP GASKET (12 X2) EA o |s 592 | ¢ - $ _
202 |PUMPER NOZZLE CAP GASKET (2 X2) EA o |s 814 | g - $ -
203 |HOSE NOZZLE CAP WITH GASKET (13 E) EA o |s 85.86 | $ B, $ _
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Item Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  [Extended Price
204  [PUMPER NOZZLE CAP WITH GASKET (14 E) EA 0o |$ 148.05 | $ - $ N
205 [STAINLESS STEEL COTTER PIN (16 W) EA 0o |$ 593 |3 - $ B
206  [FULL FACE GASKET (17 X) EA 0o |$ 3553 |3 - $ B
207  |LIPPED GASKET (17) EA 0o |$ 3553 |3 - $ B
208  [BREAK FLANGE O-RING (XB) EA 0o |$ 65.88 | $ - $ B
209  [LOCK RING (18) EA o |$ 2207 | $ - $ B
210 |UPPER ROD (TRAFFIC MODEL ONLY) (19 DB) EA 0o |$ 108.82 | $ - $ .
211 BARREL (TRAFFIC MODEL) — 3'0" (20 BB) EA 0 N/A | $ - $ -
212 ADD FOR EACH ADDITIONAL 6” OF BARREL EA 0 N/A | s - $ -
213 [HEXNUT (21) EA 0o |$ 223 | g - $ B
214  [HEXBOLT (22) EA o | 223 | - $ B,
215  |EXTENSION STEM COUPLING(B) EA 0o |$ 119.92 | $ - $ }
216 |(HS) EA 0 |$ 1772153 - $ -
217 BREAKABLE BOLT & NUT-1 EACH (23,25 VB) EA 0 $ 2147 | $ - $ R
218  [BARREL FLANGE (24) EA 0o |$ 14212 | - $ }
219 FLANGE BOLT & NUT-1 EACH (25,29V) EA 0 $ 1332 | $ - $ R
220 |BREAKABLE COUPLING (26 CB) EA 13 |'$ 133.24 | 1,732.12 $ -
221 LOWER ROD-PER FOOT (27 D) EA 0 $ 4441 | ¢ - $ -
222 BARREL (NON-TRAFFIC)-3'0" (28) EA 0 $ 877.20 | $ - $ R
223 ADD FOR EACH ADDITIONAL 6” OF BARREL EA 0 $ 63.66 | $ - $ R
224  |BRONZE STEM (30 S) EA 0o |$ 703.24 | $ - $ .
225  [NAILS (31 H) ' EA o |s 399.74 | § ] $ )
226 O-RING SEALS-REQUIRES 2 (32 Z2) EA 0 $ 22260 | $ - $ R
227 |VALVE TOP PIECE (33 K) EA 13 |8 157.71 | 2,050.23 $ -
228 |MOLDED VALVE RUBBER (34 J) EA 13 |$ 63.66 | $ 827.58 $ -
229  |BRONZE VALVE SEAT (35 M) EA o |$ 172.44 | - $ -
230 [VALVE BOTTOM PIECE (36 L) EA 13 | $ 7773 | $ 1,010.49 $ -
231  [BRONZE VALVE NUT (37 N) EA 13 |'$ 103.63 | $ 1,347.19 $ -
232 [(380) EA 0o |$ 39.97 | $ - $ B
233 [SET SCREW (40) EA 0o |s 226 | $ - $ -

DRIP VALVE LEATHER WITH NAILS & RIVET SET (41 $ 65.88

234 D) EA 0 $ - $ -
235 RIVET OR DRIP NAIL-SET OF 5 (58) EA 0 $ 223% - $ -
GROUP 12 SUBTOTAL $ 6,967.61 $ B
[ BID TOTAL (SUM OF GROUPDS 1 THROUGH 12)] [$ 278,154.93 ] [$ -

Items highlighted in red had no bid provided, or are sections that were not completed.
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