
Project: Commercial Water Meters
Bid Date: Thursday, October 22, 2015

ITB: #4408

SW Controls, Inc. ETNA Supply Co Badger Meter, Inc.

Base Bid - ABB Aquamaster 3 
Meters

Alternate Bid - Sensus Ipearl 
(5/8" to 1") & Sensus Omni T2 

(1-1/2" to 10")

Alternate Bid - Badger E-Series 
(5/8" to 2") & Badger M5000 (3" 

to 12")

Item Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 5/8” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,262.00$                                   130.00$                                     91.00$                                       

2 3/4” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,262.00$                                   130.00$                                     103.00$                                     

3 1” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,262.00$                                   200.00$                                     125.00$                                     

4 1-1/2” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,434.00$                                   830.00$                                     370.00$                                     

5 2” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,548.00$                                   995.00$                                     497.00$                                     

6 3” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,606.00$                                   1,250.00$                                   1,533.00$                                   

7 4” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 2,951.00$                                   2,430.00$                                   1,635.00$                                   

8 6” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 3,198.00$                                   3,680.00$                                   1,876.00$                                   

9 8” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 4,023.00$                                   6,500.00$                                   2,218.00$                                   

10 10” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 4,379.00$                                   7,260.00$                                   2,545.00$                                   

11 12” Magnetic Water Meter EA TBD 5,054.00$                                   No Bid 3,606.00$                                   

12 External Battery Pack EA TBD 270.00$                                     No Bid 124.00$                                     

13 Programming Cable EA TBD 355.00$                                     500.00$                                     No Bid

14 Spare Display Converter EA TBD 1,254.00$                                   No Bid 1,040.00$                                   

15 Connection Conversion Kit EA TBD 835.00$                                     No Bid No Bid

BID TABULATION


