
BID TABULATION 
TWO 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS 
THROUGH THE STATEWIDE  

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 
 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
 
Varsity Ford, Macomb County   $38,399.00 ea.  $76,798.00 
 
Oakland County       .  NO BID 
 
Snethkamp Dodge, State of Michigan  $38,979.00 ea.  $77,958.00  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
ONE 1 TON PICKUP WITH BOX DELETED 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE  
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
 
 
Varsity Ford, Macomb County       $22,616.00 

Berger Chevrolet, Oakland County      $23,612.00 

Red Holman GMC, Oakland County      $23,756.00 

Gorno Ford, State of Michigan       $22,734.00 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



BID TABULATION 
ONE MINI CARGO VAN 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE  
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
 
Varsity Ford, Macomb County       $20,807.00 
           
Berger Chevrolet, Oakland County      $20,821.00 
 
State of Michigan         NO BID 
   
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
ONE ¾ TON PICKUP TRUCK WITH CREW CAB 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
          
Varsity Ford, Macomb County       $25,139.00 
 
Berger Chevrolet, Oakland County      $26,806.00 
            
Red Holman GMC, Oakland County      $26,685.00 
 
Snethkamp Dodge, State of Michigan   .   $26,682.00  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
ONE ¾ TON PICKUP TRUCK WITH CREW CAB AND FOUR WHEEL DRIVE 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
          
Varsity Ford, Macomb County       $29,876.00 
 
Berger Chevrolet, Oakland County      $29,988.00 
            
Red Holman GMC, Oakland County      $29,951.00 
 
Snethkamp Dodge, State of Michigan   .   NO BID 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
NINE ¾ TON PICKUP TRUCK WITH FOUR WHEEL DRIVE 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
          
Varsity Ford, Macomb County  $26,275.00 ea.   $236,475.00 
 
Berger Chevrolet, Oakland County $26,458.00 ea.   $238,122.00 
            
Red Holman GMC, Oakland County $26,564.00 ea.   $239,076.00 
 
Snethkamp Dodge, State of Michigan $26,435.00 ea.   $137,915.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
FOUR FULL SIZE CARGO VANS 

THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 

 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
          
Varsity Ford, Macomb County  $23,259.00 ea.   $  93,036.00 
 
Jim Riehl’s Ram, Oakland County  $26,238.00 ea.   $104,952.00 
            
Gorno Ford, State of Michigan  $24,388.00 ea.   $  97,552.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TABULATION 
ONE 15 PASSENGER VANS 
THROUGH THE STATEWIDE 

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM 
 
 
BIDDER         TOTAL BID PRICE 
          
Varsity Ford, Macomb County       $30,303.00 
 
Oakland County      .   NO BID 
            
Gorno Ford, State of Michigan       $30,580.00 
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