STATE OF MICHIGAN
CENTRAL PROCUREMENT SERVICES

Department of Technology, Management, and Budget

525 W. ALLEGAN ST., LANSING, MICHIGAN 48913
P.O. BOX 30026 LANSING, MICHIGAN 48909

CONTRACT CHANGE NOTICE

Change Notice Number 8

to
Contract Number 071B7700180

(517) 249-0455
dufoury@michigan.gov

888-923-5338 229
bcampbell@signatureautogroup.com
CV0033084

OWOSSO MOTORS INC SW
0O :
le}] 1960 East Main Street
=8 Owosso, M 48867
§ Bill Campbell Yvon Dufour DTMB
(9]
|
o
~

CONTRACT SUMMARY

VEHICLES - PATROL, PASSENGER, TRUCKS AND VANS |

August 1, 2017 November 30, 2022 1-2Year November 30, 2022

| O P-Card [0 PRC I Other Yes [0 No

o | | 0 | | November30,2022
$3,500,001.00 $0.00 $3,500,001.00

: DESCRIPTION
Effective 1/27/2022, the following amendment is hereby incorporated into the contract. Model year 2022 award is added to this
contract (attached). Al other terms, conditions, specifications and pricing remain the same. Per contractor proposal, and DTMB
Procurement approval.




CHANGE NOTICE NO. 8 TO CONTRACT NO. 071B7700180

FOR THE CONTRACTOR:

OWOSSO MOTORS INC

Company Name

E-SIGNED by Bill Campbell
on 2022-01-27 21:12:26 GMT

Authorized Agent Signature

Bill Campbell

Authorized Agent (Print or Type)

2022-01-27 21:12:26 UTC

Date

FOR THE STATE:

E-SIGNED by Yvon Dufour
on 2022-01-28 12:36:15 GMT

Signature

Yvon Dufour Category Specialist

Name and Title

DTMB Central Procurement Services

Agency

2022-01-28 12:36:15 UTC

Date



2022 MY PRICING

Spec # DESCRIPTION

Year

HYBRID VEHICLES: PASSENGER, FULL SIZE (Front
Wheel Drive)
4 Door Sedan (. ic T )

2022

HYBRID VEHICLES: PICK-UP, 4-6" BOX, (FWD) Crew Cab
(5,000 Ibs min GVWR)

2022

ELECTRIC VEHICLES: PICK-UP, 5'-6" BOX, (4 Wheel
Drive) Crew Cab (7,000 Ibs min GVWR)

2022

ELECTRIC VEHICLES: CARGO, ELECTRIC, VAN, (130" &
148" Wheelbase) (9,500 Ibs min GVWR)

2022

ELECTRIC VEHICLES: CARGO, ELECTRIC, VAN, (130" &
148" Wheelbase) (9,500 Ibs min GVWR)

2022

ELECTRIC VEHICLES: STRIPPED CHASSIS, ELECTRIC,
VAN, (178" Wheelbase) (9,500 Ibs min GVWR)

2022

ELECTRIC VEHICLES: CUTAWAY, ELECTRIC, VAN, (178"
Wheelbase) (9,500 Ibs min GVWR)

2022

HYBRID VEHICLES: PASSENGER, MID SIZE (Rear Wheel
Drive) 4
Door Sedan_{, Ti i )

2022

0040-2WDU [TWO WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: 5 PASSENGER, 4
DOOR,
FRONT WHEEL DRIVE ic T

2022

0040-2WDU | TWO WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: 5§ PASSENGER, 4
DOOR,
FRONT WHEEL DRIVE A 1K

2022

0040-2WDU | TWO WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: 5 PASSENGER, 4
DOOR,
FRONT WHEEL DRIVE A ic Ti

2022

| FOUR WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: UTILITY 4x4, 4
DOOR (Payload 900 Ibs., min.)

2022

|FOUR WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: UTILITY 4x4, 4
|DOOR
(Payload 900 Ibs., min.)

2022

| FOUR WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: UTILITY 4x4, 4
{DOOR
(Payload 900 Ibs., min.)

2022

|FOUR WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: UTILITY 4x4, 4
|DOOR
|(Payload 900 Ibs., min.)

2022

| FOUR WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: UTILITY
| VEHICLE, FULL SIZE, 4-DOOR, 6 PASSENGER (Payload
11,480 Ibs., min.)

2022

|FOUR WHEEL DRIVE UTILITY VEHICLE: UTILITY
[VEHICLE,
LARGE, 6 to 8 PASSENGER (Payload 1,500 Ibs., min.)

2022

LARGE UTILITY VEHICLES: UTILITY, 4-DOOR, 5-6
PASSENGER,
FULL SIZE (Payload 1,500 Ibs., min.)

2022

LARGE UTILITY VEHICLES: UTILITY VEHICLE, 6
PASSENGER,
HALF TON (Payload 1,500 Ibs., min.)

2022

0071-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY MIDSIZE,
EXTENDED
CAB (Approx. 6' Box) (Payload 1,260 Ibs., min.)

2022

0072-4WDL  |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED
CAB (8
Foot Box) (Payload 1,300 Ibs., min.)

2022

0072A-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED
CAB
ALTERNATIVE FUEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 1,300 Ibs.,
min.)

2022

0073A-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED
CAB
ALTERNATIVE FUEL (6 Foot Box) (Payload 1,300 Ibs.,
min.)

2022

0074A-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY ALTERNATIVE
FUEL (6
Ft. Box) (Payload 1,300 Ibs., min.)

2022

0075-4WDL  |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY (8 Ft. Box)
(Payload
1,300 Ibs., min.)

2022

0075A-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY ALTERNATIVE
FUEL (8
Ft. Box) (Payload 1,300 Ibs., min.)

2022

0076D-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED
CAB,
DIESEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 2,350 Ibs., min.)

2022

0077-4WDL  |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED
CAB (6
Foot Box) (Payload 2,500 Ibs., min.)

2022

0077D-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED
CAB,
DIESEL (6 Foot Box) (Payload 2,500 Ibs., min.)

2022

0078-4WDL  |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY 8 FT. Box
(Payload
2,800 Ibs., min.)

2022

0078D-4WDL |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK 4x4: PICK UP BODY, DIESEL 8 Ft.
Box
(Payload 2,800 Ibs., min.)

2022

0079-LDT  |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY MIDSIZE, REGULAR|
CAB
(Approx. 6' Box) (Payload 1,000 Ibs., min.)

2022

‘B'Dmlﬁ" LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB

i | ALTERNATE FUEL VEHICLES (8 Foot Box) (Payload 1,400
|Ibs.,

min.)

2022

Make

Model

~ | ESCAPEHYBRID (U0OB)

Maverick Supercrew (W8E)

F150 Lightning Supercrew
(XXX)

Transit T-350 130" WB (W1Y)

Transit T-350 148" WB (W1Y)

Transit T-350 RWD (W52)

Transit T-350 RWD (W5P)

Mustang Mach-E (K1R)

Edge SE (K3G)

Escape S (UOF)

Explorer (K7B)

Bronco Sport (R9A)

Escape S (U9F)

Eco Sport S (PS1)

Explorer (K8B)

Expedition XL (U1G)

Expedition XL EL (U1G)

Expedition XL (U1F)

Expedition XL (U1F)

RANGER (R1F)

F150 (X1E)

F150 (X1E)

F150 (X1E)

F150 (FIE)

F150 (F1E)

F150 (F1E)

F250 (X2B)

F250 (X2B)

F250 (X2B)

F250 (F2B)

F250 (2FB)

RANGER (R1E)

MDOT $ flotes
Signature Ford $22,795.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $18,243.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $37,050.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $42,718.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $43,895.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $39,251.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $38,735.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $42,000.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $29,914.00 AWD. BODY CODE K4G
071B7700180
Signature Ford $20,729.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $27,023.00 Rear Wheel Drive.
071B7700180
Signature Ford $23,735.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $22,690.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $19,379.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $28,038.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $38,290.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $40,654.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $35,353.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $35,353.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $23,974.00
07187700180
Signature Ford $27,737.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $31,679.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $31,191.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $28,836.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $25,850.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $31,474.00

071B7700180

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March

071B7700180 2022
Signature Ford $20,275.00
071B7700180
Si d

ignature For $28,396.00

071B7700180




0080-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB (8 2022
Foot
Box, Payload 1,400 Ibs., min.)
0081A-LDT [LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB 2022
ALTERNATE FUEL VEHICLES (6 Foot Box) (Payload 1,400
Ibs.,
min.)
0082A-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, REGULAR CAB 2022
ALTERNATE
FUEL VEHICLES (8 Foot Box) (Payload 1,500 Ibs., min.)
0083-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, REGULAR CAB (6' 2022
Box)
(Payload 1,600 Ibs., min.)
0084A-LDT [LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB 2022
ALTERNATE FUEL VEHICLES (8 Foot Box) (Payload
1,400 Ibs.,
min.)
0084D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB, 2022
DIESEL (8
Foot Box) (Payload 3,000 Ibs., min.)
0085D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB, 2022
DIESEL (6
Foot Box) (Payload 3,000 Ibs., min.)
0085-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB (6 2022
Foot
Box) (Payload 3,000 Ibs., min.)
0086D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, CREW CAB, FOUR 2022
DOOR, SINGLE REAR WHEEL, DIESEL (6 Foot Box)
(Payload 3,000 Ibs.,
min.)
0086-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, CREW CAB, FOUR 2022
DOOR,
SINGLE REAR WHEEL (6 Foot Box) (Payload 3,000 Ibs.,
min.)
0087D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, REGULAR CAB, 2022
DIESEL (8'
Box) (Payload 3,240 Ibs., min.)
0087-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, REGULAR CAB (8' 2022
Box)
(Payload 3,240 Ibs., min.)
0088D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB, 2022
FOUR DOOR SINGLE REAR WHEEL, DIESEL 4 X 2, (8
Foot Box),
(Payload 3,500 Ibs., min.)
0088-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB, 2022
FOUR DOOR SINGLE REAR WHEEL 4 X 2, (8 Foot Box),
(Payload 3,800
Ibs., min.)
0088D-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, CREW CAB, FOUR 2022
DOOR,
SINGLE REAR WHEEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 3,700 Ibs.,
min.)
0089-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, CREW CAB, FOUR 2022
DOOR,
SINGLE REAR WHEEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 3,800 Ibs.,
min.)
0090D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB, 2022
FOUR DOOR DUAL REAR WHEEL, DIESEL 4 X 2, (8 Foot
Box), (Payload
3,970 lbs., min.)
0090-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY, EXTENDED CAB, 2022
FOUR DOOR DUAL REAR WHEEL 4 X 2, (8 Foot Box),
(Payload 3,970
Ibs., min.)
0091D-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY—STANDARD CAB, 2022
SINGLE
REAR WHEEL, DIESEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 3,800 Ibs.,
min.)
0091-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY—STANDARD CAB, 2022
SINGLE
REAR WHEEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 4,000 Ibs., min.)
0091-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY—STANDARD CAB, 2022
SINGLE
REAR WHEEL (8 Foot Box) (Payload 4,000 Ibs., min.)
0092D-LDT |[LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY—STANDARD CAB, 2022
DIESEL,
DUAL REAR WHEELS (8 Foot Box) (Payload 5,000 Ibs.,
min.)
0092-LDT |LIGHT DUTY TRUCK: PICK UP BODY—STANDARD CAB, 2022
DUAL
REAR WHEELS (8 Foot Box) (Payload 5,000 Ibs., min.)
0101D-MDT |MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK: CAB AND CHASSIS, DIESEL 2022
G.VW.R.
12,500 |bs. min., (Payload 6,200 Ib. min.)
0101-MDT |MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK: CAB AND CHASSIS G.V.W.R. 2022
10,000
Ibs. min., (Payload 4,700 Ib. min.)
0102D-MDT |MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK: CAB AND CHASSIS, DIESEL 2022
G.VW.R.
11,000 Ibs minimum (Payload 5,500 Ibs., min.)
0102-MDT |MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK: CAB AND CHASSIS G.V.W.R 2022
11,000 Ibs
minimum (Payload 5,500 Ibs., min.)
0103D-MDT |MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK: CAB AND CHASSIS, DIESEL 2022

G.V.W.R.
12,500 Ibs minimum (Payload 6,675 Ibs., min.)

F150 (X1C)

F150 (X1C)

F150 (F1C)

F150 (F1C)

F250 (X1C)

F250 (X2A)

F250 (X2A)

F250 (X2A)

F250 (W2A)

F250 (W2A)

F250 (F2A)

F250 (F2A)

F350 (X3A)

F250 (X2A)

F350 (W3A)

F350 (W3A)

F350 (X3C)

F350 (X3C)

F350 (F3A)

F350 (F3A)

F250 (F2A)

F350 (F3C)

F350 (F3C)

F350 (F3G)

F350 Single Rear Wheel
(F3E)

F350 (F3G)

F350 (F3G)

F350 (F3G)

Signature Ford

$25,523.00
07187700180
Signature Ford

$28,262.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $26,911.00
071B7700180
Signature Ford $22,328.00

07187700180

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

BODY CODE X2A

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March

071B7700180 2022
Signature Ford Prl::aﬁ:g:oiv:’::;m
071B7700180 2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE|
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
07187700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022




0111-4WDM

MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK 4X4: CAB AND CHASSIS, DUAL
REAR WHEELS (G.V.W.R. 10,000 Ibs., min.)

2022

0111D-4WDM

MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK 4X4: CAB AND CHASSIS, DUAL
REAR WHEELS, DIESEL, (G.V.W.R. 10,000 Ibs., min.)

2022

0112D-4WDM

MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK 4X4: CAB AND CHASSIS, DIESEL
G.V.W.R. 12,000 Ibs. min., (Payload 5,800 Ib. min.), 60"
Min. C.A.

2022

0113D-4WDM

MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK 4X4: CAB AND CHASSIS (Payload
5,930
Ibs., min.), 84" Min. C.A.

2022

0127-VAN

VANS: COMPAGT VAN 5 PASSENGER, FRONT WHEEL
DRIVE
(Payload 1,470 Ibs., min.)

2022

0128A-VAN

VANS: COMPACT VAN, 7 PASSENGER (Minimum),
FRONT WHEEL DRIVE ALTERNATE FUEL VEHICLES
(Payload 1,100 Ibs.,

min.)

2022

0129A-VAN

VANS: COMPACT VAN, CARGO, FRONT WHEEL DRIVE,
ALTERNATIVE FUEL (Payload 1,580 Ib., min.)

2022

CUT-AWAY VANS: Single Rear Wheel, (G.V.W.R. 8,900
Ibs., min.)

2022

' |CUT-AWAY VANS: DUAL REAR WHEEL, (G.V.W.R. 10,000
|Ibs.,
~|min.)

2022

F350 (F3H)

F350 (F3H)

F350 (F3H)

F350 (F3H)

TRANSIT CONNECT WAGON
XL (S9E)

TRANSIT CONNECT WAGON
XL (S9E)

TRANSIT CONNECT VAN XL
(ETE)

E350 (E3F)

E350 (E3F)

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford
071B7700180

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March
2022

Signature Ford

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE
until Approx. March

071B7700180 2022
Signature Ford $24,186.00
07187700180

Signature Ford $24,328.00
07187700180

Signature Ford $22,620.00
071B7700180

Signature Ford $26,492.00
071B7700180

Signature Ford $26,818.00

071B7700180




FORD PRICING

SPECIFICATION MDOT BASE +B TOTAL MDOT
SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTIONS MODEL Description s EXCEFTIONS 70
NUMBER PRICE options PRICE SPECIFICATIONS
3958-0109  [3958.-0109 CUT-AWAY VANS: DUAL REAR WHEELS E-450 (E4F Total price is for Regul
: p {Ear) E-450 REG CAB CHASSIS |  $27.880.00 | $3,032.00 | $30,912.00 | °% mu_ﬂ_nw __m MW *mmc A e
(G.V.W.R. 14,000 Ibs., min.) (14,000 GVWR) 4X2 158" WB, 100" CA chedule or options.
38580110 [3958-0110 (3958-0114) HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB F-450 (F4G) F-450 REG CAB CHASSIS | |0\ 1\ 11 ABLE until Approx. March 2022
AND CHASSIS, (G.V.W.R. 14,500 LBS., min.) (16,500 GVWR) 145" WB, 60" CA
3958.0111D |3958-0111D (3958-0115D) HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB 450 (FAG R
AND CHASSIS, DUAL REAR WHEELS, DIESEL, (G.V.W.R. -450/{FaG) ) Pricing NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022
. (16,500 GVWR) | 4X2 145" WB, 60" CA
14,500 LBS., min.)
P 58-0112 HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS
oseoiz Wmc>m_. REAR WHEELS, (G.V.W.R. 14,500 LBS., min.) (4 x F430/(FaH] F=150 REG/CAB:CHASSIS Pricing NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022
" PATE . (16,500 GVWR) 4X4 145" WB, 60" CA ’
Y 0113D -0117D) HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB
e ww,_mw M:wwm_wwwwwr zm>xv§._mmrm DIESEL, (G.V.W.R Pea50i(FeH] F-450 REG CAB CHASSIS | ;i NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022
(3958-0117D : ' (GVWR 16,500 GVWR) | 4x4 145" WB, 60" CA :
14,500 LBS., min.) (4 x 4)
3958-0116 |3958-0116 HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS, F-450 (F4H) F-450 REG CAB CHASSIS | |\ A ILABLE until Approx. March 2022
(G.V.W.R. 15,000 LBS., min.) (4 x 4) (16,500 GVWR) | 4X4 145" WB, 60" CA
3958-0118 ] ] ]
3958-0118 HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS, F-550 (F5G) F-550 REG CAB CHASSIS | .\ v AILABLE until Approx. March 2022
DUAL REAR WHEELS (G.V.W.R. 18,000 LBS., min.) (18,000 GVWR) | 4X2 145" WB, 60" CA
1 -0118D HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS,
3958-0118D |3958-0118 F-550 (F5G) F-550 REG CAB CHASSIS | .
DIESEL, DUAL REAR WHEELS (G.V.W.R. 18,000 LBS., N " Pricing NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022
o (18,000 GVWR) | 4X2 145" WB, 60" CA
X -0119 HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS,
395E0S w_uow>m_.ozm>w_~ WHEELS (G.V.W.R. 18,000 LBS., min.) (4 x F-3B0/{ESH) F-550 BEG CAE CHASSIS Pricing NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022
2 I v (18,000 GVWR) 4X4 145" WB, 60" CA '
x 3958-0119D HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS,
oSEOLED DIESEL, DUAL REAR WHEELS (G.V.W.R. 18,000 LBS FIB0:ESH) F-550 REG CAB CHASSIS | o ing NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022
o B v (18,000 GVWR) 4X4 145" WB, 60" CA ’
min.) (4 x 4)
3358-0134  13958.0134 HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS, F-650 (F6K) F-650 REG CAB CHASSIS NG BID NG BID — NO BID
(G.V.W.R. 21,000 Ibs., min.), LOW PROFILE (22,000 GVWR) 169" WB, 84" CA )
3058-0135 |3958-0135 HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS F-650 (F6K) F-650 REG CAB CHASSIS N — T NO BID
DIESEL, (G.V.W.R. 21,000 Ibs., min.) (22,000 GVWR) 169" WB, 84" CA :
X 3958-0160D HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS
233501600 . F-750 (F7K) F-750 REG CAB CHASSIS NO BID
(G.V.W.R. 33,000 Ibs., min.), SINGLE AXLE, 300 H.P. 3 - NO BID NO BID $0.00
(33,000 GVWR) 169" WB, 84" CA
DIESEL ENGINE
3958-0164D |3958-0164D HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB AND CHASSIS F-750 (F7K) F-750 REG CAB CHASSIS P — 560 NO BID
(G.V.W.R. 27,000 LBS., MIN.), DIESEL (31,000 GVWR) 169" WB, 84" CA :
PECIFICATION MIDEAL BASE | +B TOTAL MIDEAL
S SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTIONS MODEL Description R EXCEPTIONSTO
NUMBER PRICE options PRICE SPECIFICATIONS
39589169
e E 450 REGCAB-CHASSIS- | $28,080-00 | $3,032.00 | $31.11200 NOT AWARDED
3958-0110 |3958-0110 (3958-0114) HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS: CAB F-450 (F4G) F-450 REG CAB CHASSIS

AND CHASSIS, (G.V.W.R. 14,500 LBS., min.)

(16,500 GVWR)

145" WB, 60" CA

Pricing NOT AVAILABLE until Approx. March 2022




