

Vendor	Group	Price	Exceptions
East Jordan Iron Works	1	\$ 29,213.55	NO BID ON WCORPS003
	2	\$ 35,408.00	
	3	\$ 19,206.60	NO BID WSLEEVES013
	4	\$ 34,358.30	
	5	\$ 11,331.08	
Progressive Plumbing	1	NO BID	
	2	\$ 29,006.00	
	3	NO BID	
	4	NO BID	
	5	NO BID	
SLC Meter	1	\$ 25,246.65	
	2	n/z	PRICING INVALID
	3	\$ 869.64	DOMESTIC PRICING ON GLANDS ONLY
	3	\$ 847.32	IMPORT PRICING ON GLANDS ONLY
	5	\$ 11,733.12	
Municipal Supply	1	\$ 29,151.10	NO BID WCORPS003
	2	\$ 29,060.00	UNTIL 4-08-11
	3	\$ 4,203.70	NO BID ON SLEEVES OR CAPS
	4	NO BID	
	5	NO BID	
ETNA Supply	1	\$ 24,721.75	
	2	\$ 33,534.90	
	3	\$ 17,101.96	
	4	\$ 30,243.25	
	5	NO BID	
Michigan Pipe & Valve	1	\$ 29,605.00	
	2	\$ 34,300.00	
	3	\$ 15,038.00	
	4	\$ 35,920.00	
	5	\$ 12,590.00	
HD Supply	1	\$ 27,700.43	NO BID ON WCAPS003
	2	\$ 29,504.00	UNTIL 4-13-11
	3	\$ 17,396.30	
	4	\$ 30,800.80	
	5	\$ 11,373.16	